
By Lauren Bennett

	 Dorchester resident Tiffani 
Caballero has been appointed the 
new mayor’s liaison for Jamaica 
Plain, taking over for Lindsey 
Santana, who is now the Commu-

nity Outreach Manager for the 
city’s Environment Department.
	 Caballero was born and raised 
in Boston, attended the John D. 
O’Bryant School, and is current-

By Lauren Bennett

	
Over the past year and a half, 
discussion of food insecurity and 
housing insecurity has been at 
the forefront of many conversa-
tions as the pandemic impacted 
communities right here in Bos-
ton and around the globe. But 
what about menstrual care? A 
necessity for folks to lead healthy 
lives, many are not able to afford 
menstrual care products, which 
has only been made worse by the 
pandemic.
	 Dignity Matters is a nonprofit 
that partners with other nonprof-
its and organizations to provide 

menstrual care to those who need 
it most. The Sun spoke with Kate 
Sanetra-Butler, Founder and 
Executive Director of Dignity 
Matters, as well as Director of 
Development Merryl Glassman 
to learn more about the nonprofit 
and how it serves women and 
girls across the state, includ-
ing communities right here in 
Boston. The organization is also 
gearing up for its second annual 
Dignity Matters NOW Auction 
to raise funds to purchase these 
crucial items, and is hoping as 
many people as possible will bid 
on some exciting items up for 
auction. 

	 Dignity Matters was started 
five years ago, as “an organiza-
tion that’s focused on providing 
free period protection as well 
as underwear and bras,” Sane-
tra-Butler said, for adults as well 
as school-aged individuals.
	 “Our mission is critical be-
cause SNAP benefits do not cover 
period protection,” she said. Ad-
ditionally, “for most of these orga-
nizations and the vast majority of 
women we’re supporting, we are 
the only source,” Glassman add-
ed, saying that menstrual care 
products are not often donated. 

By Gazette Staff

	 Tiffani Caballero, una res-
idente de Dorchester, ha sido 
nombrada el nuevo enlace del 
alcalde para Jamaica Plain, re-

emplazando a Lindsey Santana, 
quien ahora es la Gerente de 
Alcance Comunitario del Depar-
tamento de Medio Ambiente.
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Pickleball an 
unexpected hit in JP

Dignity Matters works to end ‘Period Poverty’ 
in state; virtual auction planned for September 

Kate Sanetra-Butler, Founder and Executive Director of Dignity Matters, delivered the first 
donation of menstrual products to the Hennigan school in 2017. The organization continues to 
partner with the Hennigan School, as well as more than 50 additional public schools throughout 
the state.  

By Lauren Bennett

	 What started as an idea for 
getting out and moving around 
turned into more than 200 inter-
ested JP residents coming down to 
South St. tennis courts each Sat-
urday morning to play pickleball.
	 Similar to tennis and ping 

pong, the game of pickleball has 
not long been a common one in 
the City of Boston and the sur-
rounding area, but over the past 
few years, the sport has gained 
traction, especially in Jamaica 
Plain.

Continued on page 10

PHOTO BY LAUREN BENNETT

Jamiece Shepard, J Cottle, and Aliza Franz worked the booth at the 
First Baptist Church to provide people with maps and information 
about JP Porchfest. See more photos on Pages 16 and 17.
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Caballero nació y se crió en Bos-
ton, asistió a la escuela John 
D. O’Bryant y actualmente es 
estudiante en UMass Boston, 
donde estudia para obtener una 
licenciatura en psicología. Ella 
también habla español. 
	 Antes de comenzar este rol en 
la Oficina de Servicios Vecinales 
hace dos meses, Caballero fue 
representante del Centro de Ser-
vicios Constituyentes para 311. 
Dijo que su nuevo cargo “casi va 
de la mano” con su trabajo ante-
rior, y este nuevo rol le permitirá 
interactuar con los electores cara 
a cara. 
	 Caballero dijo que lo que la 
atrajo al puesto de enlace de 
Jamaica Plain fue la “cultura 
realmente unida”. También dijo 
que tiene familia en el vecindario 
y aprecia las “diferentes culturas 
y herencias”. 
	 Agregó que JP es “muy inclu-
sivo para todos” y también ha 
notado los muchos cambios que 
ha experimentado el vecindario 
a lo largo de los años.
	 “Eso es realmente lo que me 

atrajo del puesto”, dijo Caballero.
	 Dado que es solo su segundo 
mes en el cargo, dijo que to-
davía se está “aclimatando” a 
las responsabilidades, pero que 
rápidamente está realizando las 
propuestas de Santana. 
	 Caballero celebró reciente-
mente su primera reunión de 
colindantes el 23 de agosto y 
trabajó en el lugar de votación 
Stop & Shop para las elecciones 
del Jamaica Plain Neighborhood 
Council el sábado pasado. Tam-
bién asistió a la celebración de 
Unity Day en el Anna Mae Cole 
Community Center y a varias 
reuniones de asociaciones de ve-
cinos.
	 La nueva enlace dijo que uno 
de sus objetivos es “amplificar las 
voces de la comunidad” y “asegu-
rarse de que haya representación 
para todos”.
	 Cuando no se reúne con elec-
tores y organizaciones de la co-
munidad, a Caballero le gusta 
“dar un paseo e ir a un nuevo 
negocio, presentarme y apoyar 
su negocio”. 
	 Puede comunicarse con Ca-
ballero en tiffani.caballero@bos-
ton.govo llamando al 617-635-
2185. 

Caballero
Continued from page 1

ly a student at UMass Boston 
working towards a bachelor’s 
degree in psychology. She’s also 
a Spanish speaker. 
	 Prior to starting this role at 
the Office of Neighborhood Ser-
vices two months ago, Caballero 
was a Constituent Service Cen-
ter representative for 311. She 
said her new position “almost 
goes hand in hand” with her 
previous work, and this new role 
will allow her to interact with 
constituents face to face. 
	 Caballero said what attracted 
her to the Jamaica Plain liaison 
position was the “really tight-
knit culture in Jamaica Plain.” 
She also said she has family in 
the neighborhood, and appreci-
ates the “different cultures and 
heritages in the JP community.” 
	 She added that JP is “very 
inclusive for everyone,” and has 
also noticed the many chang-
es the neighborhood has gone 
through over the years.
	 “That’s really what attracted 
me to the position,” Caballero 
said.
	 Since it’s  only her second 

month in the role, she said she 
is still “getting acclimated” to the 
responsibilities, but is quickly 
catching up on Santana’s pro-
posals in the neighborhood. 
	 Caballero recently held her 
first abutters meeting on Aug. 
23, and worked at the Stop & 
Shop polling location for the Ja-
maica Plain Neighborhood Coun-
cil election last Saturday. She 
also attended the Unity Day cel-
ebration at the Anna Mae Cole 
Community Center on Saturday, 
and several neighborhood asso-
ciation meetings. 
	 The new liaison said one her 
her biggest goals is to “ampli-
fy the community voices,” and 
“make sure there’s represen-
tation for everyone in Jamaica 
Plain, whether it’s the neighbor-
hood associations or their sub-
committees, to make sure ev-
eryone is able to get their voices 
heard.”
	 When she’s not meeting con-
stituents and organizations in 
the community, Caballero said 
she likes to “take a stroll down 
and go into a new business and 
introduce myself and support 
their business.” 
	 Caballero can be reached at 
tiffani.caballero@boston.gov, or 
by calling 617-635-2185. 

Caballero
Continued from page 1

By John Lynds

	 This week the Mayor’s Of-
fice of Arts and Culture awards 
grants to artists and organiza-
tions to create short-term public 
art projects and activations of 
public spaces through the Trans-
formative Public Art program.
	 In Jamaica Plain artist Ro-
berto Chao wil create a mural 
at Mozart Park. Chao, an artist 
who received his Masters of Fine 
Arts in 1982 from the National 
School of Fine Arts. University 
of Mexico with a concentration 
in mural painting, is no stranger 
to creating community art in Ja-
maica Plain and Greater Boston.
	 Since 1986 Chao has led or 
been engaged in dozens of com-
munity-based art projects here. 
	 In the summer of 1987 Chao 
was commissioned for the “Fresh 
Walls on Egleston Square”  com-
munity mural project through a 
Heritage Grant from the Mass. 
Council on the Arts and Human-
ities. 
	 Then in the winter of 1992-
93 he hosted the “Rice & Beans/
Raza & Bravura” art workshops 
and shows in Jamaica Plain. 

	 From there Chao created the 
“Peace Throughout History” mu-
ral with High School students 
from Jamaica Plain, the “Wake 
Up the Earth Celebration” Mural 
in Jamaica Plain, and, again with 
the help of Jamaica Plain high 
school students, created murals 
on the columns and walls at the 
Jackson Square Station Orange 
Line MBTA stop. 
	 The city grants will also go to-
wards funding Daniel Callahan’s 
MassQ Ball 2022 at the Arnold 
Arboretum. 
	 Callahan is a transmedia art-
ist and designer living in Rox-
bury MA. His work has been 
featured in the Museum of Fine 
Arts, The Isabella Stewart Gard-
ner Museum and the Institute of 
Contemporary Art and has been 
featured in such publications 
as Believer Magazine, The Bay 
State Banner, and Words Beats 
& Life: The Global Journal of 
Hip-Hop Culture.
	 A graduate of UPenn School 
of Design Callahan received the 
Fine Arts Chair Award for out-
standing work in a senior thesis 
exhibit, a current Graduate MFA 
Fellow in the Visual Media Art 

Program at Emerson College, 
and co-founder of the artist col-
lective Fear & Fancy out of Oak-
land CA.
	 “Imagine an art event where 
instead of looking at objects 
on walls we look at each other; 
where instead of going to see art, 
we become it; where people can 
convene, converge and celebrate 
what makes us both unique and 
unified,” said Callahan in a state-
ment about the ball. 
	 Finally, these art grants will 
also fund Dunamis’ Jamaica 
Plain Porchfest 2021. 
	 The city has allocated a total 
of  $750,000 in funding for mural 
projects at 10 sites across nine 
Boston neighborhoods as well as 
another $323,950 for 27 short-
term projects. 
	 “(Art) brings joy and inspira-
tion to communities, and helps 
revitalize our neighborhoods,” 
said Acting Mayor Kim Janey. “I 
hope Boston residents and visi-
tors enjoy these beautiful works 
of art, and that these projects en-
courage those who pass by them 
to find creative ways to brighten 

Local artists and organizations receive 
city grants to increase public art in JP

Continued on page 6
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By John Lynds

	 Haiti was still recovering from 
the violent 2010 earthquake that 
killed 200,000 Haitians when an-
other magnitude 7.2 earthquake 
struck the Tiburon Peninsula 
struck the impoverished country 
on Saturday, August 14. 
	 The latest earthquake killed 
over 2,200 people, injured tens 
of thousands of others and the 
country is once again in need of 
relief. 
	 In Boston, two Hatian Amer-
ican At-Large City Council Can-
didates, James “Reggie” Colimon 
and Ruthzee Louijeune took a 
break from campaigning over 
the weekend to ask for help and 
support for Haiti.
	 Colimon, who emigrated to 
Boston as a teenager over 35 to 
join his parents, was shocked by 
the news over the weekend. 

	

“My heart, thoughts, and prayers 
go out to the people of my home-
land of Haiti, reeling from yet 
another tragedy,” said Colimon. 
“The devastating earthquake has 
rallied the Boston Haitian com-
munity together to immediately 
start the process of providing 
much-needed relief. Boston has 

the 3rd largest concentration of 
Haitians behind Miami and New 
York, and there are so many of 
us who are personally affected 
by this tragedy. We are a strong 
and resilient community that 
has always come together to help 
our brothers and sisters in Haiti 
, and let them know that we are 
here for them”.

Two Haitian Americans running for At-Large City Council ask 
for help for their homeland in the wake of latest earthquake 

Candidate for City Council 
Ruthzee Louijeune.

Candidate for City Council 
James “Reggie” Colimon.

	 Louijeune, the daughter of 
Haitian immigrants, asked vot-
ers to donate to Haiti relief funds 
	 I’m saddened to hear about 
another earthquake in Haiti,” 
said Louijeune, who lost a rela-
tive during the 2010 earthquake 
that devastated the country. 
“So far, all my family members 
are okay but not everyone can 
say that. At age of 23, I crossed 
the Dominican Republic border 
alone into Haiti three weeks 
after (the 2010 earthquake) to 
bring resources to my family. 
(Saturday’s earthquake) brought 
all that back. Please keep Hai-
ti and the Caribbean in your 

thoughts and prayers.”
	 Louijeune and Colimon said 
those wishing to help Haiti can 
donate to Haitian Americans 
United, a local nonprofit with 
many members from the affected 
area. They are organizing a dona-
tion collection effort. Donations 
can be sent to the “Haitian Amer-
ican United” via check by mail 
to HAU P.O. Box 260440, Mat-
tapan, MA 02126 (memo: “Haiti 
August 2021 Earthquake”) or 
by direct deposit at East Boston 
Savings Bank, Account # 07-774-
15001 or on paypal at paypal.me/
donatetohauinc. 
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	 Hooray! Tree removal from 
private as well as public prop-
erty may finally be regulated in 
Boston. 
	 After an initial hearing into 
District 5 City Councilor Ricardo 
Arroyo’s “Ordinance Establish-
ing Protections for the City of 
Boston Tree Canopy” on Aug. 
24, work to review and edit the 
details and language to craft a 
final version now begins.
	 The ordinance went to the 
City Council Committee on Gov-
ernment Operations, originally 
cosponsored by District 9 City 
Councilor Liz Breadon, and now 
by 12 of the 13 City Councilors. 
(Councilor Kim Janey, acting 
mayor, was not listed as having 
signed on as of this writing.)
	 The ordinance comes pur-
posely, Arroyo said in an inter-
view earlier this month, at a 
time when an Urban Forest Plan 
(UFP) “for the protection and ex-
pansion of Boston’s urban forest” 
is being developed by the Parks 
and Recreation Department with 

a consultant team and a commu-
nity advisory board. The UFP 
project will work in collabora-
tion with designers of the final 
ordinance, Parks Commissioner 
Ryan Woods and Arroyo said at 
the hearing. Equity is a key goal 
of both efforts.
	 At a City Council hearing in 
2018, local City Councilor and 
current Council President Matt 
O’Malley quoted a study that 
says every mature tree gives 
$293 worth of benefits to its sur-
roundings every year.
	 In addition to adding beauty 
and value to a community, trees 
help reduce bad stuff like storm 
water run-off, heat island effects, 
respiratory ailments and energy 
usage.
	 Most important, trees take 
in carbon dioxide and give off 
oxygen—a much-needed double 
service in combatting climate 
change.
	 Seven councilors, several ad-
ministrators from the Environ-
ment, Energy and Open Space 

Department and members of 
the public noted those bene-
fits in support of the ordinance 
throughout the hearing using 
words like “thank you,” “excited,” 
and “grateful.”
	 The Boston ordinance pre-
sented this week, like most, 
specifically deals with what are 
called “significant” trees in the 
city—both on public and private 
property. Significant trees are 
defined in Boston’s as non-in-
vasive and 8 inches or more in 
diameter at chest level (4.5 feet).
	 A key provision is that no one 
would be able to remove a signif-
icant tree or trees from private 
property without first obtaining 
a permit from the Tree Warden. 
In most cases, before removal, 
the applicant would have to 1) 
show plans to replace existing 
trees with similar ones on or 
adjacent to the property or 2) 
pay the Boston Street Tree Fund 
an amount equal to the cost of 
purchasing, planting and main-
taining similar trees.
	 Owner-occupants of 1-3 fam-

ily houses would have an easier 
time. They could be granted a 
waiver of the requirement to 
replant trees or make a payment 
with no need for a hearing. If 
the owner moves or sells within 
18 months of getting a waiver, 
though, it would be revoked.
	 A fine of $100 per day for 
every day until an application 
is filed would be levied against 
anyone who removes a signifi-
cant tree without a permit.
	 The Boston ordinance adds to 
the responsibilities of the Tree 
Warden and creates of a Senior 
Urban Forestry and Landscape 
Planner position as well as an 
Urban Forestry Committee. It 
discusses public trees and many 
other details of regulations for 
protecting Boston’s tree canopy. 
For the full text of the ordi-
nance presented, go to https://
www.boston.gov/sites/default/
files/file/2021/08/0858.PDF.
	 Tree advocates who testified 
brought up real concerns about 
developers rushing in to quickly 
cut down trees and the advocated 
some kind of moratorium on cut-
ting down trees for development 
until a tree ordinance takes ef-

fect. A large group of advocates, 
including environmental activist 
Sarah Freeman of the Arborway 
Coalition and others from JP, 
signed a letter to all the City 
Councilors last week, calling for 
one.
	 Suggestions made by the 
public and the councilors and 
administrators at the hearing 
will be taken into consideration 
during the workshop phase, Ar-
royo pointed out several times.
	 The goal stated in Imagine 
Boston 2030, developed by for-
mer Mayor Marty Walsh’s ad-
ministration, is to increase Bos-
ton’s tree canopy to 35 percent. 
As of 2019, our canopy had held 
steady at about 27 percent for 
four or more years. Protecting 
existing trees will make the rea-
sonable goal of 35 percent much 
easier to achieve.
	 “No one will be surprised to 
hear that I am very supportive of 
a tree ordinance,” Freeman said 
during her testimony. “The best 
time to enact it was 20 years ago. 
The second-best time is now.”

	

JP Observer 
Much-needed ordinance to protect our tree canopy is on the way

By Sandra Storey / Special to the Gazette

Adult Foster Care – A Win-Win for Caregiving
C A R E G I V E R  S O L U T I O N S

Boston Senior Home Care’s Adult Foster Care Program supports caregivers and 
the older adults and individuals with disabilities who rely on them for assistance 
with daily living activities. Caregivers receive a generous stipend, customized 
care plan, training, and support. Care recipients benefit from personalized care 
and the ability to remain at home – where they want to be.

Ready to learn more? Visit bshcinfo.org or call 617-292-6211.

Eligibility requirements apply.
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PHOTO BY MARK STOREY

Many mature trees were preserved, especially along the 
wooden fences of existing houses, during the development 
of a multi-acre subdivision in Austin, Tex. recently. New trees 
(not pictured) were planted throughout the development, as 
well. The photographer’s home is on the other side of the 
fence and down a few houses to the right.

Continued on page 5
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She said that she sees not con-
flict between creating affordable 
housing and protecting trees. “A 
healthy community has both,” 
she said.
	 “No tree ordinance existed,” 
Arroyo said when I asked him 
why he drafted one for Boston in 
an interview earlier this month. 
He said when he learned Boston 
doesn’t regulate the removal of 
all trees, he was “surprised.”
	 He cited the heat waves here 
this summer and findings of a 
2020 Tree Canopy Assessment 
by the City as specific reasons 
regulations need to be in place. 
The special aerial photography 
showed that Boston’s tree can-
opy remained relatively stable 
2014-2019. More tree canopy was 
lost on residential land than any 
other type, he added.
	 The report also showed that 
the neighborhoods that suffered 
the most tree canopy losses were 
Hyde Park, Roslindale, Matta-
pan and West Roxbury. Arroyo 
has represented parts of Hyde 
Park, Roslindale, Mattapan 
and Readville as District 5 City 
Councilor since he took office in 
2019.
	 Arroyo noted that Cambridge, 
Lexington, Newton, Somerville 

and Wellesley have tree ordi-
nances. He said he and his staff 
looked at tree removal regula-
tions in other cities and states 
around the country, including 
Austin, Tex. and Rhode Island, 
before crafting the proposed or-
dinance. 
	 They sometimes even inter-
viewed officials there about what 
they thought worked well and 
what didn’t, Arroyo said. Atlanta, 
Palo Alto, and Portland, Ore. are 
just a few cities, in addition to 
Austin, that have had tree ordi-
nances for quite a while. In some, 
the tree removal regulations are 
sprinkled among other about 
open space or development.
	 Speak for the Trees Execu-
tive Director David Meshoulam 
presented a list of requests for 
specific changes to the current 
ordinance during his testimo-
ny, and others who testified lat-
er said they supported them. 
Suggestions included “aligning” 
the ordinance with zoning and 
Boston Planning and Develop-
ment Agency processes, “stricter 
enforcement,” adding heritage 
trees and historical trees to the 
“significant trees” category, mak-
ing the smallest diameter of a 
significant tree 6 inches instead 
of 8, and more.
	 When plans were announced 
to develop acres of property be-
hind my brother and sister-in-
law’s house in Austin in 2016, 

they first worried about what 
would happen to the small forest 
portion behind their back yard. 
But they realized Austin had a 
tree ordinance that applied to 
such situations since at least 
2011. Many mature trees were 
preserved on the land, and new 
trees were planted scattered 
among the 35 single-family hous-
es and condos and a new street. 
	 Councilors and administra-
tors at the hearing agreed with 
Arroyo when he said he thought 
additional resources would be 
needed to carry out the tree pro-
tection ordinance. Calling the 
ordinance “urgent,” Chair of the 
Ways and Means Committee 
Kenzie Bok said she was hopeful 
that jobs money in the American 
Restoration Plan could be used. 
Many said the jobs money would 
ideally go to Bostonians.
	 The right spirit seems to be 
there. Now we just need the 
crafting of the final version of 
this mainly sensible ordinance 
to go smoothly and quickly and 
funding found. We’ve been with-
out complete tree protections far 
too long already in Boston.
	 As Freeman said in an inter-
view before the hearing, “Any city 
turning a blind eye to the fate of 
its trees is not doing its job.”
	 Sandra Storey is the founder 
and former publisher of the Ja-
maica Plain Gazette.

JP Observer
Continued from page 4

Staff report

Asian Americans of different 
descents proudly endorse  Erin 
Murphy to serve as At-Large 
Boston City Councilor, citing Er-
in’s commitment to strong edu-
cation, safe neighborhoods, and 
compassionate citizenship. 
	 AAPI ( Asian American Pa-
cific Islanders) Action Group, 
the largest coalition of  Chinese, 
Indian, Filipino,  Nepalese , and 
Vietnamese grassroots organiza-
tions, gave its official backing to 
Erin’s campaign as it develops 
tremendous momentum in the 
build up to the September 14 
preliminary election. 
	 “Erin is a candidate for all 
seasons. She is a breath of fresh 
air in the Boston political scene - 
an authentic voice with common 
sense and good heart,” Sanjay 
Kaul, co-founder of AAPI Action 

Group said. “ Erin is the true 
Asian American candidate, even 
if she does not look like us. She 
shares our core values of en-
gaged citizenship and strength 
thru togetherness, “ Joe Wong, 
a Chinese American civic leader 
and lifelong Chinatown resident 
said. “Erin is running for all the 
right reasons - giving back. She 
is a rising star in the political 
scene- a much-needed inspira-
tional leader and a braveheart,” 
Sandhaya KC a Nepalese Amer-
ican leader said.   “As a former 
Boston Public School teacher, a 
single mom of 4, and an inclusive 
public advocate of long stand-
ing, Erin will bring Boston back 
- together. Boston needs Erin,” 
Frank Celoza. a Filipino-Amer-
ican veteran said. 
	 A lifelong Dorchester resi-
dent, Erin has centered her cam-

paign around being Boston’s go-
to call at City Hall.
	 Erin’s vision for Boston and 
her campaign are built on her 
core beliefs:
	 Thriving, best-in-class 
public schools for every stu-
dent in every neighborhood 
A friendlier city for seniors, with a 
more compassionate policy focus 
Stronger outreach to veterans, 
out of respect for their service 
and supporting their needs 
Safer streets and polic-
ing across the City, priori-
tizing community policing 
All hands-on-deck to pull us 
out of the pandemic, partic-
ularly our most vulnerable 
Reducing income inequality by 
promoting good jobs for all Bos-
tonians
	 AAPI Action Group strongly 
supports Erin Murphy as their 

AAPI action group endorses Murphy for City Council at-Large

one and only candidate for at-
large Boston City Council. AAPI 
Action Group asks all Bosto-
nians of different descents to 
get Erin Murphy elected in the 

Sept. 14 primary. It’s time to 
Bring Boston Back. Together. A 
vote for Erin is a vote for action 
not words, before and after the 
election.

Candidate for City Councilor-at-Large Erin Murphy with a 
supporter.
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Council holds hearing on home rule petition for Mildred Hailey redevelopment
By Lauren Bennett

	 The City Council Committee 
on Government Operations held 
a hearing on August 16 regard-
ing a home rule petition relating 
to the Mildred C. Hailey housing 
development.
	 The docket was sponsored by 
Acting Mayor Kim Janey and 
the chair of the committee is 
Councilor Lydia Edwards.
	 “This home rule petition 
would authorize Boston Housing 
Authority (BHA) to participate in 
a redevelopment and revitaliza-
tion of the Mildred Hailey Hous-
ing Development using federal 
funds,” Edwards said.
	 Additionally, it would per-
mit “certain exemptions…to the 
state’s contract procurement 
and award laws. Chapter 149 
requires a structured filed sub 
bid process that has separate re-
quirements for general contrac-
tor and subcontractor selection.”
	 Edwards said that the Mil-
dred Hailey development “is se-
verely distressed,” and similar 
legislation has been approved by 
the city for such developments 
as Whittier St., Mission Main, 
Old Colony, Orient Heights, and 
many more.
	 “So this is a typical home rule 
petition that we’ve often done for 

other neighborhoods,” Edwards 
said.
	 City Councilor Matt O’Mal-
ley said that “this is obviously 
easy….what we’re talking about 
today is going to really help facil-
itate something that will be life 
changing not only for the neigh-
borhood of Jamaica Plain, but 
for the City of Boston as we talk 
about an incredible partnership 
with JPNDC, with Urban Edge, 
with TCB, and of course with 
BHA.”
	 Joel Wool, Chief of Staff at 
the Boston Housing Authority, 
was on hand to explain a little 
bit about the proposed project at 
Mildred Hailey.
	 BHA is seeking to move 
forward with Phase One of the 
Mildred Hailey Redevelopment 
Project,” he said. “This would 
cause for the creation of 673 
homes and a new Anna Mae Cole 
Community Center.”
	 He continued, “this project is 
exciting for a number of reasons.” 
Wool said that 253 of the existing 
units will be replaced one-for 
one, “as is the BHA’s protocol to 
do one-to-one replacement of the 
units that are affordable at 30 
percent of the income.”
	 Additionally, the project 
includes 420 additional units, 
some of which are “middle in-

come units” to cater to a variety 
of incomes.
	 The first phase of this project 
does not include the entirety of 
the housing development, and 
Wool said that the BHA and oth-
ers “will have a continued con-
versation about what will hap-
pen with the rest of the units.”
	 The new Anna Mae Cole Cen-
ter will be approximately 6,800 
square feet, he added.
	 “The project itself is a part-
nership of multiple entities—
Centre St. Partners—that in-
cludes three Boston-based non-
profits: JPNDC, The Community 
Builders, [and] Urban Edge,” 
Wool said.
	 He then talked about the “leg-
islative relief ” from state law 
that is required to move forward 
with this project. He said that 
Chapter 149 includes “somewhat 
antiquated provisions that really 
restrict the ability to move for-
ward in the manner that is best 
suitable in this process,” adding 
that it “often restricts the BHA 
from moving forward.” 
	 Johanna Hynes, a Charles-
town resident, spoke during the 
public comment period about her 
concerns for the removal of trees 
as part of this project, though 
she said she does support the 
additional housing it will create.

No drought 
about it

An Ivy rain barrel will help your 
garden grow.

> Removable locking lid
> Screened inlet
> Holds 50 gallons
> Available in forest green or black
> Made in the USA
> Recycled plastic

Public price $112.00, member price $95.20

100 Terrace Street, Boston, 02120  
Order online for pick-up, or just stop by
Monday–Friday 8:30–4:30 n Saturday 9:30–3 
617-442-2262

bostonbuildingresources.com
a member-owned co-op

O’Malley to endorse Mary Tamer 
for Boston City Council - District 6
By Gazette Staff

	 On Saturday, August 21, Bos-
ton City Councilor Matt O’Mal-
ley endorsed Mary Tamer for 
Boston City Council District 
6 outside of the Jamaica Pond 
Boathouse.  O’Malley announced 

he would not be seeking re-elec-
tion late last year, and Tamer is 
one of three candidates running 
for his seat.
	 Mary Tamer is a former Bos-
ton School Committee member 
and past president of the League 
of Women Voters of Boston.

where they live.”
	 Last year, Janey said 24 pub-
lic art projects were awarded 
grants totaling $35,000. The pro-
gram relaunched as a key part 
of Janey’s Joy Agenda, which is 
a citywide invitation, opportuni-
ty, and investment in the City’s 
collective well-being. 
	 In the spring Janey put out 
a call to artists and after an ex-
haustive application process the 
local artists were chosen by the 
city to create art around the city.  
	 “Paying artists to integrate 
bold, new artwork throughout 
our neighborhoods is a step in 
the right direction as we focus 

on reopening our city and coming 
back together around the notion 
of joy and renewal,” said Kara 
Elliott-Ortega, Chief of Arts and 
Culture for the City of Boston. 
	 The selected artists will 
also work with consultant Liza 
Quiñonez, a creative entrepre-
neur and founder of the award 
winning urban contemporary art 
and design agency Street Theory. 
	 Quiñonez will provide proj-
ect administration services and 
provide the artists with proposal 
development guidance, commu-
nity engagement strategy and 
support, technical assistance, and 
logistical production and support. 
	 “It’s an exciting time for Bos-
ton and I look forward to work-
ing with the selected artists on 
bringing their vision to life in big 
and bold ways,” said Quiñonez.

	 “Can’t we do better?” she 
asked. “I mean, the BHA alone 
is responsible for the decimation 
of thousands of mature trees 
from its properties.” She said she 
wants to have more conversa-
tions on how trees can be saved.
	 “A one for one replacement 
of mature trees is not sufficient, 
especially when those trees are 
saplings.”
	 Councilor O’Malley respond-
ed by saying that “the folks that 
live there deserve better housing 
than what they have…the plan 
that we’re going to do here is 
absolutely going to be life-chang-
ing.” He added that the “work on 
the tree canopy is not in conflict 
with also providing individuals 
safe housing…wonderful and 
energy-efficient housing. I ap-
preciate the feedback, but I think 
it’s being misdirected to be com-
pletely candid.”
	 Councilor Edwards said that 
she and Hynes “agree that trees 
should be centered,” and said 
that “how we develop has been 
one of the biggest reasons that 
we have emissions issues and 
climate change in Boston.”
	 Hynes had said that it is “not 

housing or trees,” and Edwards 
said she agrees. “And it shouldn’t 
be,” she said. “This is about the 
process and making sure that it 
can continue.”
	 Sarah Freeman, a JP resident 
and climate activist, thanked the 
council “in advance for taking 
Johanna’s and others’ comments 
into heart.” She also expressed 
concern for planting new small 
trees, saying they are going to 
take 60 years or more to grow to 
the height of the existing ones. 
“We’re talking generations,” she 
said. 
	 “I think we’re all on the 
same page here,” O’Malley said. 
“I think we know that we need 
more, better housing and deeply 
affordable and certainly look-
ing at the guiding principles of 
environmentalism is something 
that I know Sarah and I have 
worked very closely on and we 
will continue to do that.”
	 At the end of the hearing, 
Edwards explained that if this 
home rule petition passes the 
City Council, it must be approved 
by the Mayor, after which it will 
move on to the State House “for 
further consideration.”

Art grants
Continued from page 2
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By John Lynds 

 	 Acting Mayor Kim Janey to-
day announced face masks will 
be required in all indoor public 
settings in Jamaica Plain and 
the rest of the City of Boston, as 
part of a five-point plan for the 
delta variant, a more contagious 
COVID-19 mutation that is now 
the primary strain of the virus. 
	 The public health order, is-
sued by the Boston Public Health 
Commission, will go into effect 
at 8:00 a.m. on Friday, August 
27 in the City. The City is imple-
menting this proactive public 
health plan to mitigate commu-
nity transmission of the Delta 
variant, ahead of the arrival of 
more than 50,000 college stu-
dents from across the country 
and a return to school for more 
than 50,000 Boston Public School 
students. Most of the 100,000 
children who live in the City of 
Boston are too young to be eligi-
ble for vaccination. 
	 “There is nothing more im-
portant than Boston’s safe recov-
ery, reopening, and renewal from 
the ongoing COVID-19 pandem-
ic,” said Janey. “We know that 
masks work best when everyone 
wears one. Requiring masks in-
doors is a proactive public health 
measure to limit transmission 

of the Delta variant, boost the 
public confidence in our busi-
nesses and venues, and protect 
the residents of our city who are 
too young for vaccination.” 
	 On Friday, the city will re-
quire all people over age two to 
wear a mask or face covering, 
“whenever they are indoors on 
the premises of a business, club, 
place of assembly or other place 
that is open to members of the 
public, including but not limited 
to retail establishments, restau-
rants, bars, performance venues, 
social clubs, event spaces, and 
municipal buildings”. 
	 “The Delta variant contin-
ues to create an additional chal-
lenge to stopping the spread of 
COVID-19 in our community,” 
said Interim Executive Director 
of the Boston Public Health Com-
missionRita Nieves. “Wearing a 
mask indoors along with getting 
more people vaccinated will offer 
more protection to all our resi-
dents, including children under 
12 and those who are not able to 
get vaccinated.”
	 While Jamaica Plain’s week-
ly positive COVID test rate de-
creased after experiencing a 26 
percent increase in the weekly 
COVID positive test rate be-
tween July 30 and August 6, the 
Delta variant of the virus is still 

prevalent and triggered the city 
to update its mask mandate this 
week.
	 According to the week-
ly report released last Friday 
released by the Boston Public 
Health Commission (BPHC), 
1,805 Jamaica Plain residents 
were tested last week and 2.1 
percent were found to be positive. 
This was a 38 percent decrease 
from the 3.4 percent that tested 
positive between  July 30 and 
August 6.  
	 Of the 42,580 Jamaica Plain 
residents tested for COVID since 
the pandemic began, 7.5 percent 
overall were found to be posi-
tive–this was the same percent-
age reported by the BPHC on 
August 6. 
	

Citywide, the weekly positive test 
rate decreased 10 percent last 
week after experiencing a steady 
increase since early July. Accord-
ing to the BPHC 22,466 residents 
were tested and 3.5 percent were 
COVID positive--this was a 3.5 
decrease increase from the 3.9 
percent reported by the BPHC 
two weeks ago.
	 According to the BPHC data, 
Jamaica Plain’s infection rate in-
creased 2.8 percent since August 
6 and went from 769.5 cases per 
10,000 residents to 791.2 cases 
per 10,000 residents. 
	 Eighty-eight additional Ja-
maica Plain residents became 
infected with COVID-19 since 
August 6 and the number of total 
cases here went from 3,107 cases 

to 3,195 cases in the neighbor-
hood. 
	 The statistics released by 
the BPHC as part of its weekly 
COVID19 report breaks down 
the number of cases and infec-
tion rates in each neighborhood. 
It also breaks down the number 
of cases by age, gender and race.
	 Citywide positive cases of 
coronavirus increased 1.3 per-
cent since August 13 and went 
from 74,052 cases to 75,047con-
firmed cases in a week. There 
were three additional deaths in 
Boston from the virus and the 
total deaths from COVID is now 
at 1,404.
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You show up, take on everything 
they throw at you, stand up for 
what you believe in, and get the 
job done. We’re proud to stand 
right alongside you.

Member FDIC | Member DIF
NMLS # 457291

Facebook.com/EastBostonSavingsBank

   800.657.3272     EBSB.com

Jamaica Plain COVID infections decrease as Janey updates mask mandate for indoor venues 

Classes start 9/11/2021
284 Armory St | Jamaica Plain, MA | tonywilliamsdancecenter.com

617.524.4381 | suzytwdc@gmail.com | Class for Ages 3 - Adult
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Classes are filling fast! We have a vaccinated staff 
and are remaining masked in the studio. Recital is 

planned for June at the Strand Theater. Come and 
Dance with Us
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BEST PLACE TO:
1) Enjoy the outdoors          
2) Work            
3) Enjoy live entertainment                       
4) See art           

CONSUMER FAVORITIES
5) Friendliest Business          
6) Breakfast           
7) Lunch            
8) Dinner           
9) Latin American Food          
10) Asian Food           
11) Bakery           
12) Pub/Bar           
13) Pizza           
14) Cup of coffee          
15) Retail store (not convenience)         
16) Convenience store          
17) Personal service (hair, dry cleaning, etc.)        
18) Real estate service          
19) Bank or financial service         
20) Professional service (lawyer, doctor, insurer, etc.)       
21) Home service (plumber, electrician, carpenter, cleaner, etc.)     
22) Auto shop             

BEST BUSINESS IN AN AREA (ANY TYPE)
23) South Street           
24) Egleston Square          
25) Hyde/Jackson Square          
26) Centre Street (Monument to Canary Square)       
27) Forest Hills           
28) Washington Street (between Egleston and Forest Hills)      

THE REST OF THE BEST
29) Community event          
30) Playground/tot lot          
31) Mural           
32) Children’s service or activity         
33) Health service          
34) Local school           
35) Neighborhood association or group (no office)       
36) Nonprofit service agency (office)        
37) Gay/lesbian hang-out/meeting place        
38) Storefront           
39) Government service          
40) JP environmental group or effort         

Write clearly.
Vote in at least 5 categories.
Vote for the same thing ONLY ONCE.
Vote only once, please.
Photocopies of this survey are acceptable.
Entries or items that violate these rules will not be 

counted. Deadline: 5 p.m. Wednesday, Sept. 1

SUBMIT THIS COMPLETED SURVEY IN ONE OF TWO WAYS
1. Visit jamaicaplaingazette.com and click the pop up link to submit your votes online!

2. Mail: Best of JP, Jamaica Plain Gazette,  7 Harris Ave.,  Jamaica Plain, MA 02130

Results in the 
“Guide to Jamaica Plain”

Sept. 10, 2021

20th Annual

‘Best of  JP’ Reader Survey
Tell us what you love about JP!

Morrison’s 
Auto-Rite

Outstanding Service since 1969!

617-522-4444
www.morrisonsautorite.com

Call for an  
appointment

475 Centre St
Jamaica Plain 
On the 39 bus and 
convenient to the 

Orange Line

The Timing Belt and Fan Belts 
are a vital part of your engine.

Maintain MaxiMuM 
perforMance and reliability.

Staff Report

 
	 The  Community Economic 
Development Assistance Cor-
poration  (CEDAC) approved 
$11,578,537 in early stage fi-
nancing to 16 non-profit commu-
nity development corporations 
across Massachusetts in the sec-
ond quarter of 2021. This lend-
ing supports affordable housing 
developments in cities and towns 
from Boston to Northampton.
	 “These commitments, which 
represent a strong second quar-
ter of lending activity, support 
a variety of affordable housing 
projects that are tailored to the 
needs of the community,” said 
Roger Herzog, CEDAC’s execu-
tive director. “We are proud to 
support our non-profit develop-
ment partners as they create 
affordable and supportive hous-
ing for families, seniors, and vet-
erans. These projects will help 
ensure that some of our most vul-
nerable populations have a safe, 
affordable place to call home.”   
	 CEDAC’s recent commit-
ments include the following proj-
ects:
	 •Mildred Hailey Building 
1A, Boston -  The Community 
Builder’s (TCB) Mildred Hailey 
Building 1A project in Boston is 
the first phase of a major rede-
velopment of this public hous-
ing in Jackson Square, which 
is being undertaken by Centre 
Street Partners, LLC, a part-
nership between TCB, Urban 
Edge Housing Corporation, and 
Jamaica Plain Neighborhood De-
velopment Corporation. The full 
scope of Phase One will replace 
253 existing public housing units 
and create an additional 425 
new mixed-income units to be 

constructed over a 10-year de-
velopment schedule. Building 1A 
will create 100 affordable apart-
ments, a community center, com-
mercial space, and underground 
parking for three of the Phase 
One buildings. The development 
will include a 6,800 square foot 
community center with educa-
tional programming for children. 
The unit mix includes thirteen 
4-bedroom units and five 5-bed-
room units, which serves the 
needs of existing families and 
addresses the high demand for 
larger apartments. CEDAC, in 
partnership with its affiliate 
the Children’s Investment Fund 
(CIF), has committed a $1 mil-
lion predevelopment loan for this 
project. In addition to improving 
the quality of and expanding 
access to early childhood educa-
tion and out-of-school-time pro-
grams for children from low- and 
moderate-income families, CIF 
supports affordable housing for 
low-income families.
	 •170 Cottage Street, Chel-
sea - The Neighborhood Develop-
ers, Inc. (TND) plans to acquire 
a vacant site one block from 
the MBTA Silver Line Station 
and create 66 affordable family 
units. All units will be afford-
able to households at or below 
60% area median income, in-
cluding 16 units designated for 
households at or below 30% AMI 
and five fully accessible units. 
The building will be designed to 
meet Passive House energy effi-
ciency standards and universal 
design best practices. CEDAC 
has committed $4.3 million in ac-
quisition financing and $500,000 
in predevelopment financing to 
support this development.

CEDAC commits over $11.5 
million in second quarter of 2021
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“They are needed every month, 
so it’s a constant need.” Dignity 
Matters is able to purchase these 
products at a discounted price. 
	 The organization grew from a 
humble beginning, starting out 
of Sanetra-Butler’s basement 
in Wayland, to now distributing 
products to more than 150 non-
profit organizations in the state, 
50 of which are in Boston. “They 
vary from domestic violence cen-
ters, shelters for the homeless 
population, medical centers, as 
well as just public schools with 
a high rate of poverty,” she said.
	 About a year and a half ago, 
distribution was expanded to 
food pantries as well to help a 
“population that simply cannot 
afford to buy monthly menstrual 
care,” she said. 
	 In the Jamaica Plain area, 
Dignity Matters serves nine 
Congregate Family Shelters of 
the Massachusetts Housing and 
Shelter Alliance (MHSA), Wom-
en Connecting Affecting Change, 
Elizabeth Stone House, and City 
Mission Boston, as well as the 
James W. Hennnigan School. 
	 Organizations who partner 
with Dignity Matters have at 
least a one-year commitment 
from the organization to provide 

them with menstrual care prod-
ucts. “That way, they can rely on 
it,” Sanetra-Butler said. 
	 Dignity Matters began by do-
ing collection drives for products, 
running “hundreds” of them at a 
time, she said, but it was “simply 
not enough.”
	 Sanetra-Butler said that af-
ter learning that New York pro-
vides free menstrual products 
in schools, she found out where 
they were getting the products 
from and reached out. “We’ve 
been using the same contract 
for four and a half years now,” 
she said, adding that this has 
been extended to “big national 
brands like Hanes and Fruit of 
the Loom” for underwear as well.
	 “That’s really about 80 per-
cent of what we distribute,” she 
said. “We can’t purchase it with-
out the help of our amazing de-
velopment team.”
	 Glassman said, “we support 
other organizations that help 
these women. These organiza-
tions know these women; they 
know their needs. They have 
their trust.”
	 Sanetra-Butler added, “at the 
same time, they are experts in 
knowing their clients and what 
their clients need on a daily ba-
sis. We are experts on logistics, 
supply chain, and menstrual 
care. It just makes sense for the 
benefit of the women we serve 
that we partner with nonprof-

its. We secure funding, ordering, 
shipping, [and] delivering it to 
women in a timely manner.” 
	 The pandemic presented a 
challenge to Dignity Matters, not 
only with the additional women 
needing products, but also with 
production of the products them-
selves. 
	 “A lot of the work we did had 
to be changed,” Sanetra-Butler 
said, including working around 
not being able to have the sev-
eral hundred typical volunteers 
together to help. Distribution 
went from monthly to bimonthly, 
which required more coordina-
tion, she said. 
	 Glassman added that the 
manufacturers of the menstrual 
care products were also manu-
facturing PPE like gowns and 
masks during the height of the 
pandemic, but she was “we are 
really grateful that they were 
able to get it done for us” and pro-
vide the products needed. There 
were “a lot of moving parts,” she 
said. 
	 Glassman spoke a little bit 
about the upcoming auction, 
which will be accepting bids 
from September 16th to the 23rd. 
Items up for bid include an Ulti-
mate Red Sox Tour and Tickets, 
an insider ticket package for 
Hamilton on Broadway, rounds 
of golf at Willowbend and the 
Hopkinton Country Club, rock 
climbing and zip-lining experi-
ences, and various gift cards to 
restaurants, stores, spas, muse-

ums, and more. 
	 “We have absolutely been 
blown away by the support from 
local businesses and organiza-
tions,” Glassman said. 
	 “We, unlike a lot of organiza-
tions during COVID felt like it 
was just the right time during 
COVID to raise additional 
funds,” she said.
	 Glassman said that between 
March and June of last year, 
the number of people served 
“more than doubled” from 4,000 
to 8,500 a month, so more fund-
ing was required to support the 
growing number of women in 
need.
	 The virtual auction was what 
they came up with to help raise 
additional funds to ensure these 
critical products could continue 
to be provided, while still ensur-
ing the safety of everyone during 
the pandemic. 
	 Last year, the goal was to 
raise $15,000, and $20,000 was 
raised. This year, the goal is to 
raise $30,000, but Glassman said 

that the hope is to get closer to 
$40,000 or $45,000.
	 “So far, we’ve had a really 
great response from folks reg-
istering and wanting to get in-
volved in the auction,” she said. 
“We’re really excited about it.” 
	 Now, Dignity Matters serves 
nearly 11,000 women a month, 
with that number growing by 
the day with new requests from 
organizations. “We need people 
to step up,” Sanetra-Butler said. 
“If every woman in the state do-
nated $1, we wouldn’t even have 
this issue.” 
	 She continued, “without peri-
od protection, women can’t even 
go get food. Of course, for us, 
it’s one of the most important 
needs. It’s like medication; you 
just have to have it.”
	 To register to bid at the virtu-
al Dignity Matters NOW Auction 
and support Dignity Matters’ 
mission, visit bit.ly/dignity-mat-
ters-now. For more information 
about Dignity Matters, visit dig-
nity-matters.org.  
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Advertise your services! Call 617-524-7662

Christine Rose, LMT
Trained in Lymphatic Drainage, Deep Tissue/Sports and Swedish Massage

3464 Washington Street JP.  
www.imanimassage.com • 617.821.2875! 

Imani ~ a relaxation place
MASSAGE

FITNESS TRAINING
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CHIROPRACTORS

 Chiropractic Care  
Dr. T.J. Mercurio 

Jamaica Plain Chiropractic Office
512 Centre Street 617-522-0546

For Your 
HealtH Mind & BodY

Sally Friar, DC
520 Centre St., JP

617-458-1613
by appointment only

Friar
Chiropractic

ChiropraCtiC pErSoNaL FitNESS CoaChiNG

$89
30 Day All Access 

Coaching Trial
New clients only

617-435-0213 • info@myjpfitness.com

Are you MINDing YOUR business? 
Advertise your services here!  

Call 617-524-2626 x223 or 225

G.J. “Chip” Bradish, LMHC
Jamaica Plain, MA  • 617.524.6807
gjbradish@gmail.com
www.centerground.org

Practicing in JP since 1996.

for growth and development. New group starting this fall.CoaChiNG aND CoUNSELiNG
R
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Dr. T.J. Mercurio 

Jamaica Plain Chiropractic Office
512 Centre Street 617-522-0546

For Your 
HealtH Mind & BodY

Sally Friar, DC
520 Centre St., JP

617-458-1613
by appointment only

Friar
Chiropractic

ChiropraCtiC pErSoNaL FitNESS CoaChiNG

$89
30 Day All Access 

Coaching Trial
New clients only

617-435-0213 • info@myjpfitness.com

Are you MINDing YOUR business? 
Advertise your services here!  

Call 617-524-2626 x223 or 225

G.J. “Chip” Bradish, LMHC
Jamaica Plain, MA  • 617.524.6807
gjbradish@gmail.com
www.centerground.org

Practicing in JP since 1996.

for growth and development. New group starting this fall.CoaChiNG aND CoUNSELiNG
R

FitNESS

93151500 
 

ADVERTISEMENT 
SECTION 1.0 - NOTICE TO PROPOSERS 

CITY OF BOSTON/COUNTY OF SUFFOLK 
Boston Centers for Youth & Families 

 
Request for Proposals 

Services including the operation of the Thomas Johnson Community Center located at 68 
Annunciation Rd. Roxbury, MA 02119. 

 
 
EV00009610 
Contact Information 
Varnie Jules, Finance Unit Manager 
617-635-4920 x 2149 
 
The City of Boston, acting by and through its Boston Centers for Youth & Families Department and its 
Commissioner (the Official), invites proposals from non-profit groups for the performance of Services 
including the operation of the Thomas Johnson Community Center, financial oversight, tennis 
instruction, staffing, provision of equipment, and maintenance and particularly as set forth in the 
Request for Proposal Documents. 
 
The City of Boston ("The City"), acting by its Commissioner of Department ("The Official"), requests 
proposals for the services and/or supplies described above, as particularly set forth in the Request for 
Proposals, which may be obtained by visiting the City of Boston Public Procurement website at 
boston.gov/procurement/ and clicking on the supplier portal button to access event ID # EV00009610 
 
Proposers must meet the following minimum qualification: MUST BE a Non-profit corporation 
authorized to do business in the Commonwealth of Massachusetts, and providing recreational 
opportunities and activities for youth and families. For information specific to this RFP, please contact 
William Morales at william.morales@boston.gov  or 617-635-4920. 
  
Requests for Proposals shall be available on August 23, 2021 until the proposal filing deadline.  All 
proposals shall be filed no later than September 13, 2021 at 4:00 PM. 
 
William Morales, Commissioner 
(August 23, August 30, 2021) 

Clinical Research Study for Male Cancer Survivors
• Do you have Fatigue (tiredness)?
• Do you have a previous history of cancer?
• Has your cancer been in remission for at 

least 1 year?
• Did you receive chemotherapy or radiation 

Researchers at Brigham and Women’s Hospital are looking 
at the effects of testosterone therapy in cancer survivors 
who have fatigue and low testosterone.

There are up to 8 study visits over 9 months. 
Study participants will undergo an extensive health 
evaluation, blood tests and screening for various health 
conditions during the screening period.
Study compensation of up to $700, parking and meal 
vouchers will be provided.

To see if you may qualify, please call 1-617-525-8407 or 
email hkackley@bwh.harvard.edu. 

therapy for your cancer?

If you are a:
o Male
o Age 18-50 years
o In remission from your cancer for at least 1 

year
You could be eligible for a clinical research study

Dignity Matters
Continued from page 1
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A group was formed by Karen 
McCormack and Colleen Scanlan 
of McCormack & Scanlan Real 
Estate in 2017 with just a few 
members from the office, and has 
now grown to around 200 people.
	 McCormack said that Scan-
lan discovered the game of pick-
leball while on a trip to Martha’s 
Vineyard, and thought it might 
be a fun way to get some exercise. 
	 She said that they reached 
out to a Massachusetts pickeball 
ambassador, Peter Sullivan, who 
came to the South St. tennis 
courts by the McCormack and 
Scanlan office and “chalked off 
the lines for a pickeball court.”
	 McCormack said even on the 
very first day they were at the 
courts, people walking by would 
stop and ask what they were 
doing and how they could get 
involved.
	 “We’re right on the main 
street, so many people are walk-
ing by or coming to play tennis,” 
McCormack said. “It’s such a 
super fun sport that is really 
social also.”
	 Paula Callaghan, a realtor 
at McCormack and Scanlan, has 
been a part of the group since its 
inception. She explained that the 
game involves four people on the 
court at once, two on each side of 
the net. The paddles are a squar-
ish shape, and the court is about 
half the size of a tennis court. A 
wiffle ball type ball is used.
	 “It’s all about hand-eye coor-

dination,” she said. 
	 McCormack said that “one of 
the best parts of the sport” is that 
it’s “open to so many age levels 
and athletic abilities.” She said 
the group in JP includes people 
from ages 18 all the way up to 
their 70s and 80s. 
	 She said some members have 
come out of retirement from ten-
nis, and others have never played 
a sport in their life. Since the 
court is a fairly small size and 
no running is involved, it is a 
popular activity for many people. 
	 “Some of them are feeling like 
they’re athletes for the first time 
in their lives,” she said. 
	 “We now offer beginner ses-

sions for eight to 10 weeks,” Mc-
Cormack said. “We do it all for 
free. We didn’t realize how many 
people were going to get into it.”
	 Callaghan said that the av-
erage age in this league is about 
mid-40s up to about 70s, though 
there are some younger players 
as well. 
	 “It’s nice because the courts 
aren’t taken over by young kids 
the whole time,” she said. 
	 The pandemic put a damper 
on the pickleball playing, how-
ever. In 2020, the group did not 
gather to play because of safety 
concerns. 
	 But this year, with vaccines, 
more and more people are com-
fortable coming out again, espe-
cially since the activity is out-

side. 
	 “People were ready to get out 
of the house,” McCormack said.
	 After asking the city to come 
down and paint more lines, she 
said there are now six pickleball 
courts at the South St. tennis 
courts. There are no permanent 
pickleball nets, however, so those 
looking to play the game outside 
of when the league is there will 
have to bring their own.
	 But show up on a Saturday 
morning, and all the equipment 
is there, including balls, paddles, 
and nets, all of which have been 
purchased by McCormack and 
Scanlan. 
	 Beginners can learn the ropes 
of the game without having to 
worry about having their own 
equipment.
	 So many people have ex-
pressed interest, however, that 
McCormack has had to limit the 
number of people who can come 
each week to about 50 per Sat-

urday, and people can only come 
every other Saturday to ensure 
all are given a chance.
	 “It’s fantastic,” McCormack 
said of the game. “It’s become 
such a huge part of my social 
life.” Before starting the league, 
she said she had never even 
heard of pickleball.
	 “It seemed like a retirement 
sport,” she said. “It’s big in places 
where there are a lot of retirees.” 
But she quickly learned that that 
is not necessarily the case, and 
she said she feels it is a “good 
idea to bring to the community.”
	 Though it was originally 
Scanlan’s idea, “I’m the one who 
fell in love,” she said.
	 She said she’s also been en-
couraging the city to offer it to 
adults a couple of times a week, 
and she said that beginning in 
2020, all tennis courts that are 
resurfaced will have pickleball 
lines added.
	 She said word of mouth about 
the game has spread extremely 
quickly in the neighborhood, and 
she said she gets three to four 
emails daily from different peo-
ple who want to learn more about 
how they can get involved.
	 She also said the sport is not 
only fairly physically accessible, 
but also monetarily accessible. 
People can play in her league in 
JP for free, and other communi-
ties charge a small fee to play the 
game, unlike tennis, where many 
people belong to an expensive 
club to play.  
	 Callaghan said that “it’s 
amazing” how many people have 
connected with one another in 
the neighborhood through this 
game. 
	 “The people you meet,” she 
added, become “friends for life.”

PHOTOS BY MIKE MEJIA 

Naomi Rivera (right) reaches for the ball during a game with 
her teammate Julie Schaeffer during a game of pickleball in 
2019 (left).

Karen McCormack returning a ball during a game of pickleball 
in 2019.

Pickleball
Continued from page 1

Rachael Kulik
REAL ESTATE BROKER

1429 CENTRE ST.     WEST ROXBURY, MA 02132

INSIGHT REALTY GROUP, INC.

RACHAELKULIK.COM

RACHAEL@RACHAELKULIK.COM

(978) 514-2018

VOTE TUESDAY, SEPT. 14

Alex is running for At-Large Boston City Council because
his work for Governor Deval Patrick and Mayor Martin J.
Walsh has brought him to every neighborhood in the city
and given him the experience to do the job on Day One.

Alex Gray is a father, public servant, and Jamaica Plain
resident running to be Boston's first blind City Councilor.

Paid for by The Gray Committee
VoteAlexGray.com info@votealexgray.com
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Vote
Michelle Wu
for Mayor!

PAID FOR BY THE WU COMMITTEE

VOTE EARLY 
Margarita Muniz Academy 
12–8PM Tuesday, Sept. 7

BALLOT DROPBOX 
Jamaica Plain Branch Library 
Open 24/7 on Sept. 4–10 

HEY, JAMAICA PLAIN!

Election Day is
Sept. 14, but you can 
vote early!

(857) 220-7542 • MICHELLEFORBOSTON.COM
 @wutrain     /michelleforboston      @wutrain

210825_JPGazette.indd   1210825_JPGazette.indd   1 8/25/21   8:34 PM8/25/21   8:34 PM

By Gazette Staff

	 Last Tuesday, Mayor Kim 
Janey joined the Jamaica Plain 
Neighborhood Development Cor-
poration (JPNDC), MassHousing 
and the residents of multiple 
affordable housing sites, collec-
tively called the Pitts Portfolio, 
to celebrate the acquisition, pres-
ervation and renovation of 201 
units in Roxbury and Dorchester. 
	 JPNDC utilized $1.5 million 
in City of Boston Acquisition 
Opportunity Program (AOP) 
funding and $26 million in per-
manent MassHousing financing 
to purchase and renovate the 
units. This funding allowed for 
extensive capital improvements 
across the 201 unit portfolio, as 
well as finance the long-term 
affordability of the properties. As 
part of the work, 11 units were 
made accessible to people with 
disabilities and 14 units have 
been set aside to house formerly 
homeless individuals and fami-
lies.  
	 “This is a great example of how 
community partners can work to-
gether to ensure Boston residents 

have a place to call home,” said 
Janey at the ribbon cutting last 
week“ The ability of the City to 
keep these units affordable into 
the future is a huge win for Bos-
ton. I look forward to continuing 
to work with our nonprofit orga-
nizations, MassHousing and other 
partners to protect and preserve 
Boston’s affordable housing op-
tions.”  
	 The housing is located in 21 
buildings in Fort Hill, Nubian 
Square and Grove Hall, purchased 
from the estate of Lorenzo Pitts. 
Mr. Pitts was a successful, Rox-
bury-based owner and housing 
developer. Most of the units were 
affordable to low-income families. 
	 When JPNDC acquired the 
Pitts Portfolio in 2018, only 64 
of the 201 units had long-term 
affordability restrictions, and 
without a long-term preservation 
transaction, the remainder were 
at risk of being converted to mar-
ket-rate housing. The City’s $1.5M 
in AOP funding helped to ensure 
that all 201 units will have long-
term affordability.  
	 “Welcome home to all the res-
idents of the Lorenzo Pitts prop-

erties who now have renovated, 
modern homes where they can live 
affordably and prosper well into 
the future,” said MassHousing 
Executive Director Chrystal Kor-
negay. “MassHousing commends 
the Jamaica Plain Neighborhood 
Development Corporation and the 
estate of Lorenzo Pitts – as well 
as the city, state and private part-
ners involved in this project - for 
their commitment to preserving 
this important affordable hous-
ing portfolio in Dorchester and 
Roxbury.”
	 Overall, there are 38 one-bed-
room apartments, 87 two-bedroom 
apartments, 53 three-bedroom 
apartments, 18 four-bedroom 

apartments, two five-bedroom 
apartments and three six-bed-
room apartments. Renovations 
on the buildings and units in-
cluded masonry repairs of build-
ing facades, roof and window re-
placement at selected buildings, 
accessibility upgrades, kitchen 
and bathroom upgrades, and me-
chanical, electrical and plumbing 
system upgrades. 
	 Of the 201 units in the Pitts 
portfolio, 14 units are restricted 
to households earning 30 percent 
of Area Median Income (AMI) or 
less, 161 units are restricted at or 
below 60 percent of the Area Medi-
an Income (AMI) and 26 units are 
restricted at or below 80 percent of 

AMI. A total of 165 units are sup-
ported by project-based Section 8 
or MRVP rental subsidy. 
	 “We are tremendously grateful 
to the City of Boston and to all the 
other partners who made it possi-
ble to keep these 201 families in 
our city,” said JPNDC CEO Teron-
da Ellis. “MassHousing played an 
essential role, and DHCD, HUD, 
the Boston Housing Authority 
and the Massachusetts Historic 
Commission all contributed. And 
I especially want to thank the 
residents for their tremendous 
patience throughout the renova-
tion process, especially since most 
of it took place during one of our 
nation’s most serious pandemics.”

Janey and JPNDC cut ribbon 
on affordable housing units

Acting Mayor Kim Janey shown with members of the JPNDC, MassHousing and residents of 
the Pitts Portfolio building cutting the ribbon on the new apartments.
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By Lauren Bennett

	 The Jamaica Plain Neigh-
borhood Council Housing & De-
velopment Committee met on 
August 17 to discuss proposals 
from the Diversity, Equity, and 
Inclusion (DEI) subcommittee, 
as well as hear from Beverly 
Estes-Smargiassi, Assistant Di-
rector of Preservation & Com-
munity Development for the 
Department of Neighborhood 
Development (DND) regarding 
the Forbes Building.

SUBCOMMITTEE 
PROPOSALS

	 The DEI subcommittee has 
come forth with a two part pro-
posal to include under-represent-
ed individuals in the Housing & 
Development Committee.
	 DEI subcommittee member 
Marvin Mathelier said that “this 
was something in the making 
for quite some time,” and “we’ve 
acknowledged that this has been 
an issue.” 
	 He said that  people of color, 
renters, people who live in in-
come restricted housing, and who 
cover all areas of the neighbor-
hood are not currently adequate-
ly represented on the committee. 
	 “The majority are white and 
homeowners now,” he said of the 
current committee. “There is 

room for improvement. There is 
room for us to have deeper and 
more thought-provoking conver-
sations.”
	 He continued, “our ultimate 
goal is to ensure people of color 
and renters are able to partic-
ipate in the committee, which 
will then help shape the neigh-
borhood that we want.”
	 He said that the subcommit-
tee will “do our homework” and 
conduct outreach to members of 
the community to get them to 
join the committee.
	 Sarah Horsley, another 
member of the subcommittee, 
explained a little bit about the 
proposal, which includes two 
parts. The numbers that the 
group came up with are “based 
on the desire to be in alignment 
with the demographics of JP as 
they are now,” she said.
	 As written in the proposal, 
part one includes:
	 Part #1 - The Working Group 
recommends that the Committee 
set the following goals for par-
ticipation of under-represented 
groups as members of the H&D 
Committee: 
• 45% of Committee members be 
Black Indigenous & People Of 
Color (BIPOC)
• 50% of Committee members 
be renters
• 20% of Committee members 
be renters in income-restricted 

housing
• 33% of Committee members be 
from each of Areas A, B & C
	 Part #2 - The Working Group 
recommends that the Commit-
tee allocate designated seats for 
under-represented groups, in the 
percentages of the goals laid out 
above.
	 “We recognize that it takes 
time to do the outreach,” Horsley 
said at the meeting. The group 
said they would also like this to 
be the case for the full JPNC in 
the future. 
	 “I think we want to see these 
bodies be representative of the 
community, but at the end of the 
day, the seats need to be filled,” 
said JPNC member Kevin Rains-
ford.
	 Pam Bender, a member of the 
subcommittee, said that she and 
others “feel a sense of urgency to 
fill committee seats,” adding that 
the group is just “asking for a 
pause” on allowing anyone to fill 
the seats.
	 “I’ve tried my best whenev-
er there’s a vacant seat to do 
that outreach,” Rainsford said 
“…with lack of success. I think 
there’s a systemic problem that 
we need to look at ourselves. 
What’s the systemic issue…that 
keeps us from being able to reach 
that goal?”
	 Mathelier said that “we do see 
that…there are friction points,” 
adding that he believes the 
pause to allow for outreach will 
be beneficial. “You brought up a 
good point,” he said to Rainsford. 
“We do realize it’s going to be an 
uphill battle to some degree.”
	 Others agreed that the pause 
would be helpful and would give 
the committee the time and 
space they need to do the work.
	 “I think I am a prime candi-
date for this kind of proposal,” 
said JP resident Marvin Wat-
kins. “It really comes down to 

outreach.” He said he did not 
know about the opportunity to 
serve on the committee until 
Mathelier had reached out to 
him.
	 Housing & Development 
Committee member Carolyn 
Royce asked if a time limit could 
be placed on the pause, as “it 
really does depend on the out-
reach,” and “we’re short people 
on the committee…I really don’t 
like shutting off public partici-
pation.” 
	 After further discussion, the 
committee ended up voting to 
ask the full JPNC for this propos-
al as written with the seats held 
for underrepresented groups for 
six months. After six months is 
up, there will be a check-in, and 
the vacancies will be opened up 
to everyone. The full Council ap-
proved this request at its August 
24 meeting. 
	

FORBES BUILDING
	 The Forbes Building has often 
been a topic of conversation in 
the neighborhood recently, as 
the building is at risk of losing 
its affordability.
	 Beverly Estes-Smargiassi 
from the DND came to speak 
to the Housing & Development 
Committee about this issue from 
the city’s perspective.
	 She said that the Forbes 
building is lumped in with oth-
er buildings that had mortgages 
run by MassHousing as part of a 
program called the 13A program. 
The mortgages were 40 years, 
and “all came due in the last 
decade.” She said that there are 
approximately 13 developments 
in Boston with more than 100 
units that were a part of this 
program. 
	 Estes-Smargiassi said that 
there has been a “10 year scram-

ble” to maintain affordability in 
these buildings, but there has 
been “some success” with non-
profits like the Fenway Commu-
nity Development Corporation 
and others who have acquired 
these buildings and are “able to 
preserve those units in perpetu-
ity.” Additionally, she said that 
there are also “for-profit land-
lords who have stepped up to the 
place and extended affordability 
in their buildings.”
	 She added that the city 
“thought the Forbes Building 
would be a no-brainer,” as the 
owner has always “expressed in-
terest” in preserving the afford-
ability of the building, which is 
occupied mostly by seniors and 
people with disabilities. 
	 “Unfortunately, it has been 
harder and harder to get a yes 
with this owner,” she said.
	 The mortgage on the building 
matured in March of 2019, Es-
tes-Smargiassi said, adding that 
“then the affordability became 
highly, highly at risk.”
	 She said that the city is 
“making sure he is abiding by 
the rules for keeping buildings 
affordable for a three year tail 
after the loss of subsidy,” but “we 
are coming up to that three year 
mark in this coming March.” 
	 Estes-Smargiassi said that 
MassHousing believed there 
would be a plan to preserve af-
fordability, but she said there is 
none as of yet.  
	 She said that the Forbes 
Building “never had city money 
so we don’t have any easy lever-
age to get him to come to the 
table, so that’s a challenge.”
	 In Jamaica Plain, DND is cur-
rently tracking 21 developments, 
and Estes-Smargiassi said that 
only the Forbes Building is at 
risk right now.

Brendan Behan Pub 
378A Centre Street 

Jamaica Plain

JPNC Housing & Development Committee discusses equity proposals; Forbes Building

By Gazette Staff 

	 JP Centre/South Main 
Streets has issued a Request 
for Proposals for their third An-
nual Winter Light Show. The 
organization seeks artists who 
will use JPCSMS’ crowdfunded 
projector to create an artistic and 
dynamic light show with projec-
tion mapping that will project 
onto a local building within the 
district. Special preference will 

be given to artists from Jamai-
ca Plain. Details are available 
at https://jpcentresouth.com/ or 
by contacting Ginger Brown at 
director@jpcentresouth.com or 
(917) 942-2439.
	 Proposals open September 6 
and close on October 1, 2021. 
Artists will be selected by Fri-
day, October 8, 2021. The show 
will debut on Friday, December 
3, and continue until January 
10, 2022. The location will be 

selected together by JP Centre/
South Main Streets and the ar-
tist/s. In the past, JPCSMS has 
featured projection shows onto 
the buildings at 670 Centre St 
(City Feed & Supply), the First 
Baptist Church, and J.P. Licks.
	 The projector is the result of a 
crowdfunding campaign in 2019, 
which raised over $15,000 to 
purchase a projector that would 
innovate our holiday decorations 
campaign. In addition, the pro-

jector is available for community 
groups to use for additional art 
projects. These projects include 
Artists for Humanity, Black 
Lives Matter, and JP Together/
JP Unidas.
	 JP Centre/South Main 
Streets is a volunteer-driven, 
501(c)(3) non-profit organization 
that seeks to guide the growth 
of Jamaica Plain’s Centre and 
South Streets’ business district 
through the active collaboration 

of residents, business owners, 
and others committed to a com-
munity-led initiative. In partner-
ship with Boston Main Streets, 
we provide a direct conduit to the 
City of Boston and can provide 
technical assistance to help new 
businesses succeed. Our orga-
nization, with the help of busi-
nesses and residents, endeavors 
to sustain our lively community 
with economic vitality, arts, and 
advocacy.

JP Centre/South Main Streets seek artists for winter light show
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HOME    SERVICE     GUIDE

 
HANDYMAN

 
     Gutter cleaning, fences, sheetrock, roof leaks, brick pointing,  
                  carpet inst. & removal, masonry, carpentry, painting, & odd jobs.            
                                     Doors and Windows. Fast & reasonable.            

                            Call Phil at 617-868-1578 • 857-312-0543 (cell)

AC E  H A N DY M A N

WOODWORKING CLASSES

Kares
Painting

Female owned & operated. 20+ years 
experience. Honest & affordable.  No job 
too big. Free estimates. NO RIP-OFFS! 

Ask about our 
LOWEST PRICE GUARANTEE.

Cynthia “Kare” Shephard 
617-930-0582(cell) • karespainting@aol.com

Finely Detailed Interior & Exterior Painting

Advertise in the Guide 617-524-7662

Rich Gargiulo
617-821-4701

LANDSCAPE DESIGN & INSTALLATION

Design and Construction
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LANDSCAPING/LANDSCAPE CONSTRUCTION

• Landscape maintenance  
• Hydroseeding  
• Seed • Sod  
• Tree service
• Commercial 
   & Residential
• Free estimates

Stone, brick,
or block walls, 

patios & 
driveways

• Fence installation
• Paving

 617-590-2510 
FULLY INSURED 

& BONDED

Bobcat 
Service

  LANDSCAPING & 
CONSTRUCTION, INC.

Call for 
Estimates

GENERAL CONTRACTORELECTRICAL CONTRACTOR

MSS ELECTRICAL

781-727-3694

Serving Jamaica Plain and Surrounding Communities

DARK SKY INITIATIVE AND 
CPTED PRACTITIONER  WITH A GREENER 

APPROACH TO THE ENVIRONMENT

LICENSED, INSURED
IN COMM OF MASS

AASSBBEESSTTOOSS  AANNDD  MMOOLLDD

PAINTING & CARPENTRY

CARPENTRY

JP
     PAINTING

CARPENTRY

 INT.  EXT.

617-852-7409 JP resident  

HOME    SERVICE     GUIDE

XXXXX

Licensed Contractor 
(lic #CS 088319)

(617) 549-6029 Free estimates

Thomas Murray Home Improvement
Carpentry • Painting • General Home Repairs

Remodeling
( Interior & Exterior )

HOME IMPROVEMENT

Mass lic # 9290

Free estimates
Licensed & Insured

PLUMBING

Karem Plumbing
Plumbing, heating & gas work

No job too small
(617) 361-6532
Member Better Business Bureau

ROOF LEAKING?
•Emergency Leak Repair 24/7

• Ice & Snow Removal 
• Asphalt Shingles 

• Rubber Roof Systems
• Flat Roof of all kinds

• Gutters - Downspouts - Drains
• Chimney - Dormers - Skylights

(617) 888-8058
Senior & Vets 20% Discount 

Free Estimates
Family owned & operated • 28 years in business

Licensed Insured

ROOF LEAKING?
• Emergency Leak Repair 24/7 • Ice & Snow Removal 

Asphault Shingles • Rubber Roof Systems • Flat Roof of all kinds 
• Gutters - Downspouts • Chimney - Dormers - Skylights

Free Estimates 
Family owned & operated • 28 years in business

ROOF REPAIR

(617) 888-8058
Senior & Vets 20% DiscountLicenced Insured

ROOFING
 

HANDYMAN
 

     Gutter cleaning, fences, sheetrock, roof leaks, brick pointing,  
                  carpet inst. & removal, masonry, carpentry, painting, & odd jobs.            
                                     Doors and Windows. Fast & reasonable.            

                            Call Phil at 617-868-1578 • 857-312-0543 (cell)

AC E  H A N DY M A N

LANDSCAPING/LANDSCAPE CONSTRUCTION

• Landscape maintenance  
• Hydroseeding  
• Seed • Sod  
• Tree service
• Commercial 
   & Residential
• Free estimates

Stone, brick,
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By Lauren Bennett

	 The Jamaica Plain Neighbor-
hood Council (JPNC) met virtu-
ally for the first time since its 
election on August 21. Eleven 
members were elected, leaving 
nine vacancies between all ar-
eas of the neighborhood and At-
Large seats.
	 The Council reported that 
there was low turnout at this 
year’s election, chalking it up to 
the late summer date and the 
fact that all seats ran uncon-
tested. The election has already 
been postponed several times 
because of the pandemic, and 

was supposed to take place last 
year.
	 JPNC member Michael Reis-
kind said he recalls seeing be-
tween 300 and 600 votes in other 
years. Former JPNC Chair Kevin 
Rainsford, who no longer sits on 
the Council as of this meeting, 
said that there were about 350 
ballots cast for the past few elec-
tions.
	 For this election, there were 
about six write-in votes, each of 
which was only voted for once 
so those people did not meet 
the requirement of 25 votes for 
nomination. 
	 Currently, there are two va-

cancies in Area A, five in Area B, 
one in Area C, and one At-Large. 
Alexis Rickmers nominated her-
self for Area C, and Marvin Wat-
kins nominated himself for Area 
A. A second announcement of 
vacancies is needed before voting 
on these nominations. 
	 When it came time to vote 
for new officers, JPNC member 
Bernie Doherty said he didn’t 
feel it was appropriate to elect 
them that night since about half 
the seats are vacant and whoever 
fills them in the coming months 
will not have had any input.
	 The group compromised and 
elected three interim officers: 

Samantha Montano as chair, 
Bernie Doherty as Vice Chair, 
and Michael Reiskind for Sec-
retary/Treasurer. In a couple of 
months,  permanent officers will 
be elected.
	

ZONING COMMITTEE
	 After the officers discussion, 
the Council moved on to commit-
tee updates, starting with the 
Zoning Committee, chaired by 
Dave Baron. 
	 Baron said that there was 
only one matter up for a vote, 
which was a proposal at 104-
104B Jamaica Street, in which 
the owners want to build a three 

unit residential townhouse 
building with off-street parking 
in the rear.
	 “That was the second meet-
ing with the Zoning Committee,” 
Baron said of the project. There 
are many violations involved 
with the project, including side 
yard setback, which caused the 
side yard neighbor to have some 
opposition.
	 Between the first and second 
times this project came before 
the committee, there were some 
design changes made and the 
neighbor eventually decided not 

PROFESSIONAL DIRECTORYPROFESSIONAL DIRECTORY
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JPNC holds first meeting after 2021 election of members 

Continued on page 15
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to oppose the new design, Baron 
said. 
	 JPNC member Bernie 
Doherty expressed his frustra-
tion with the recommendation 
of approval by the committee. He 
said due to the many variances, 
“that is amazing that we’re just 
letting this pass through.”
	 The full Council did vote to 
approve the proposal.
	

PUBLIC SERVICE
COMMITTEE

The Public Service Committee, 
chaired by Michael Reiskind, met 
to hear a proposal from Simpli 
Bar & Bites at 3840 Washington 
St. for a 7-day common victual-
ler wines and malt beverages 
license, as well as take-out and 
an entertainment license for two 
TVs. The hours of operation are 
6am to 11pm.
	 Reiskind said that an abut-
ters meeting had not been held 
in time due to turnover in the 
Mayor’s Office of Neighborhood 
Services, so the committee’s rec-
ommendation to approve was 
contingent on no abutters being 
in opposition once the meeting 
was held. The abutters meeting 
did happen and no neighbors had 
concerns.
	 The Licensing Board met in 
July and requested a letter of 
approval before the last week 
in August, which Reiskind said 
would be sent once the full Coun-
cil votes on this project.
	 He said that the outdoor patio 
is a “very nice patio that they 
added before,” and it faces the 
orange line so no residents are 
impacted by it. He also said that 
the manager is “long standing” 
and “competent.”
	 The Council voted to approve 
this request.
	
HOUSING & DEVELOPMENT 

COMMITTEE
	 Housing & Development 
Committee member Marvin 
Mathelier reported on the com-
mittee’s August meeting, which 
consisted of a discussion of pro-
posals by the Diversity, Equity, 
and Inclusion subcommittee to 
gain more members of the Hous-
ing & Development Committee 
from underrepresented groups, 
as well as the group’s discussion 
of the Forbes Building.
	 Mathelier explained the 
proposal, which includes specif-
ic percentages of people from 

the BIPOC community, renters 
,those living in income-restrict-
ed housing, and a percentage of  
members to be from each area 
of the neighborhood in order for 
the committee to best reflect the 
neighborhood as a whole. 
	 The full council voted for the 
subcommittee to move forward 
and conduct outreach to these 
groups for the next six months 
to recruit new members.
	 For the Forbes Building, no 
vote was going to be taken, but 
David Nollman, a member of the 
Forbes Building Tenant Associa-
tion and the Massachusetts Alli-
ance of HUD Tenants (MAHT), 
along with Michael Kane, Direc-
tor of the MAHT, came to this 
meeting to ask the Council for 
their support in preserving af-
fordable housing in the building.
	 Nollman explained the back-
ground of the building, which 
includes the fact that the 40 year 
mortgage has ended, but a policy 
is in place to require the landlord 
to allow residents to stay in their 
apartments for an additional 
three years “in conditions fairly 
close to” what they have been for 
years. “Some people have been 
there for 30, 40 years,” Nollman 
said, adding that many residents 
are elderly and/or disabled. 
	 He said that any increase in 
rent, even five percent, would 
make a huge difference to many 
of the tenants in this building. 
A petition has been created that 

has hundreds of signatures call-
ing to keep the building afford-
able.
	 “If we could get the support 
of the JPNC, that would be a 
huge win for us,” he said. He also 
spoke about several changes the 
landlord has allegedly proposed 
for the building and the neigh-
borhood.
	 Kane said that the landlord 
has always talked about want-
ing to preserve affordability in 
the building, but right now no 
agreement has been made to do 
so. 
	 “The bottom line is he needs 
to sign the contracts now that 
preserve affordable housing,” 
Kane said. 
	 “I think everyone wants to 
keep affordable housing,” said 
Michael Reiskind, but he ex-
pressed concern that only one 
side had been heard at this meet-
ing.
	 “We almost never vote on is-
sues when we hear only one side, 
and we’ve heard only one side,” 
he said. 
	 A meeting has been scheduled 
for August 26 with members of 
the JPNC and the owner of the 
Forbes Building, the JPNC re-
ported. 
	 “I hear and respect the coun-
cil’s desire to hear both sides,” 
said Pam Bender, a member of 
the Housing & Development 
Committee, but she said there is 
a “sense of urgency here. People 

are going to lose their homes.” 
	 Bernie Doherty agreed. “The 
need is urgent. It is now, it is 
here,” he said. “We need to deal 
with it now.”
	

After further discussion and sug-
gestions, the Council ultimately 
voted seven to one to sign the 
petition.  

Quality, Affordable Residential Care for Seniors 62+

NO entrance fee
income or asset

restrictions!

• Private bedrooms with full bath
• 24-hour personal care assistance
• Medication administration
• 3 Home-style meals daily
• Laundry and housekeeping services
• Leisure and wellness activities
• Lovely common areas
• 100% accessible

Since 1901

MOUNT PLEASANT HOME

301 South Huntington Avenue, Jamaica Plain
www.MountPleasantHome.org

617-522-7600

730 Center Street, JP 02130
617-983-5177 • www.jpseafoodcafe.com

2001-2007, 2012 & 2014-2017, 2018 - 2020
Open Tues. Weds. Thurs. 

Sun. 4pm to 10pm
Fri. & Sat. 12 noon - 10pm

Enjoy Summertime!

Inside Dining 
Available

Delivery & Pick Up

*All participants will receive $25 after completion of their 
visit. To complete the visit, participants must create an 
account, give consent, agree to share their electronic 
health records, answer health surveys, and have their 
measurements taken (height, weight, blood pressure, etc.), 
and give blood and urine samples, if asked.

All of Us and the All of Us logo are service marks of the U.S. 
Department of Health and Human Services.

Why have some communities not 
been a part of medical research?

You can help researchers develop new and better 
treatments that benefit all of us.

Many groups of people have been left out of 
research in the past. That means we know less about 
their health. When you join the All of Us Research 
Program, you'll help researchers learn more about 
what makes people sick or keeps them healthy.

JoinAllofUs.org/NewEngland  
(617) 768-8300 

JPNC
Continued from page 1

ELECTION RESULTS SIDEBAR:
At the JPNC election on August 21, there were 131 Ballots 

cast - 19 at Stop & Shop, 29 at Forest Hills and 83 at JP 
Licks.  Of those who voted 25 were from Area A, 50 were from 

Area B, and 56 were from Area C.  
	 The breakdown of votes are as follows:

Area A
Marvin Mathelier - 21

Brandon Yu Iisuka Russell - 18
Trevor Wissink-Adams - 15

Area c
Gert Thorn - 38
Peg Preble - 28

Bernard Doherty - 32
Micah Sachs - 32

At large
Michael Reiskind - 85

Dave Baron - 74
Will Cohen - 74

Samantha Montano - 79
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COMMUNITY CELEBRATES WITH JAMAICA PLAIN PORCHFEST 2021

WORMS?
INFECTIONS?

DISEASE?

BYE FELICIA!

angell.org

Angell Animal Medical Center | 350 S. Huntington Ave, Boston | 617-522-7282

24/7 Emergency Vet Care
Weekend Appointments  |  Free On-Site Parking

With services ranging from
24/7 emergency & critical
care to cardiology; from
behavior services to surgery, 
Angell has everything you
need to keep them healthy
and happy.

• 24/7 Emergency
 & Critical Care
• Anesthesiology
• Avian & Exotic
 Medicine
• Behavior
• Cardiology
• Dentistry
• Dermatology

• Diagnostic Imaging
    (with on-site CT)
• General Medicine
• Internal Medicine
• Neurology
• Oncology
• Ophthalmology
• Pathology
• Physical
 Rehabilitation
• Surgery

Angell is Here to Help!

 Gazette Pet of the Week
                by Sarah Carroll

B E A R  &  C H L O E
Bear is looking for a home with his best friend, Chloe! 
They grew up in Texas with a loving family, but when the new baby 
was born there wasn’t enough time for the dogs anymore. They 
moved into their “grandparents” farm for the time being, where Bear 

lost an eye trying to be 
friends with a not-so-
friendly feral cat. He 
has not held a grudge 
and is still friendly 
with kitties, as well as 
other dogs. They love 
making new human 
friends and would do 
well with dog-savvy 
kids 12 and up.

Sponsored by:

Sarah Carroll, realtor®The Residential Group
at William Raveis Real Estate
16 Clarendon St., Boston MA 02116
781-820-0280 or 
sarah@residentialgroup.comwww.buddydoghs.org

For more information about
Bear & Chloe and or other animals 
in need of adoption, please contact:

Photos by Lauren Bennett

	 JP Porchfest was back in per-
son for 2021, but Tropical Storm 
Henri forced the second day to be 
postponed until August 28.
	 On August 20, music could be 
heard at 28 different locations 

throughout the neighborhood 
from 11am to 4pm. 
	 “Thank you to every perform-
er, porch host, sponsor, volunteer, 
partner and every person in-
volved! Thank you to our commu-
nity for opening your homes to 
us!” JP Porchfest wrote in a post 

on its Facebook page following 
the first day of performances. 
“Hearts were filled today and 
we have you to thank.” 
	 Dunamis Boston is producing 
JP Porchfest this year, and for 
folks who cannot or do not want 
to head out to various porches, 
JP Couchfest was also an option 
this year.  From August 16 to 
August 20, performances were 
given virtually so people can 
enjoy from the comfort of their 
own homes. 
	 Additionally, this year a spot-
light has been placed on BIPOC 
performers.
	 “Porchfest is still open to 
anyone in terms of audience, 
performer or porch host but we 
wanted to make sure that we 
spotlighted artists who rarely 
have access to these opportuni-
ties,” a statement on the Porch-
fest website reads. This year, 
BIPOC performers have been 
centered, and performers are 
paid. 
	 For more information about 
Porchfest, as well as a map 
and schedule of performance 
locations for August 28, visit 
jpporchfest.org.       

Shown above, Many folks 
got up to dance to the upbeat 
music of School of Honk. 

Shown to the left, Noah Pettit, 
Ella Batty, and Leo enjoyed 
the music at Rogerson House.

Christiana Goslin and Rabah Ameziane danced to the music 
on the lawn at the First Baptist Church. 
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COMMUNITY CELEBRATES WITH JAMAICA PLAIN PORCHFEST 2021

Candidate for Mayor of BostonPaid for by Cappucci Committee

Pro-Life
Pro-Police
Pro-Veterans
Pro Exam Schools

Please vote for me!

#7 on the ballot

Thom Dunn of The Roland Highlife performed some solo 
tunes at the Wenham Street Cinema before two of his other 
bandmates joined him. 

School of Honk performed at the Anna Mae Cole Community Center while many residents 
gathered to enjoy the fun. 

Neighbors gathered at the Wenham Street Cinema to enjoy music from T.S. I Love You and 
The Roland Highlife.

Several groups gathered on the lawn of the Rogerson House 
to hear live music from artists like Emmanuel Ramirez, James 
Dargan, Amanda Shea, Miguel Landestoy, and DJ Rozey, all 
of whom performed throughout the day at this location.
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By Gazette Staff

	 Mayor Kim Janey an-
nounced the winners of the 
25th annual Mayor’s Gar-
den Contest with a grand 
prize provided by JetBlue 
and prize packages donat-
ed by Mahoney’s Garden 

Centers. The Mayor’s Gar-
den Contest recognizes 
gardeners who have land-
scaped, planted flowers, 
trees, shrubs, and, in the 
process, helped beautify 
Boston’s neighborhoods. 
	 “I am proud to carry 
on Boston’s tradition of 

commemorating those 
who help keep our neigh-
borhoods vibrant and in-
viting,” said Mayor Kim 
Janey. “I first learned the 
joys of gardening from my 
grandmother and have 

PLEASE WRITE…

Editorial Put Kendra Hicks in City Hall

Mandate is step in right direction

Continued on page 19

Make the most of the
 rest of summer

If nothing else, the Summer of 2021 has taught us an age-old lesson: The only thing 
that is certain about life is uncertainty.
Remember when President Biden told the country in the spring that his goal was to 
have the pandemic restrictions lifted across the country by July 4?
At that time, the Delta variant of COVID-19, though already responsible for a huge 
surge in deaths in India and other places, constituted only a tiny fraction of cases in 
the United States.
But by July 4, almost all of the COVID cases in the U.S., among both the vaccinated 
and unvaccinated, were attributable to Delta, which is many times more contagious 
than original COVID and proving to be far deadlier among the unvaccinated, partic-
ularly for younger age groups.
Today, COVID-19 is raging as never before and restrictions on our normal living are 
being reinstated. 
The extent of the tragic and sad situation that has been unfolding in Afghanistan 
(though foreseeable by some) caught the U.S. government and the American people 
completely off-guard. Afghanistan registered barely a blip on the news cycle at the 
start of the summer, but now it dominates the news.
And although scientists have long warned us of the overall effects of climate change, 
the catastrophic weather events of this summer -- the floods, wildfires, and drought 
-- have been felt in every corner of the globe.
Then, as if to place an exclamation point on the extent of life’s vicissitudes, just this past 
weekend, the wonderful Concert in Central Park was cut short by a lightning storm.
If the Summer of 2020 was notable for lockdowns, the Summer of 2021 will be re-
membered as a real-life version of Whack-a-Mole, when we never were able to regain 
our footing on the path to normalcy because of all of the obstacles that continuously 
sprung up along the way.
There are just two weekends left in the Summer of 2021, our Summer of Uncertainty.
We hope that all of our readers will make the most of the summer days that are left, 
but do so safely.

The unvaccinated are rebels 
without a cause

For the majority of our readers -- who are vaccinated (because we live in Eastern 
Mass.) -- the reasons being given by those who refuse to get the shot, even when they 
are dying in the hospital, are inexplicable.
The most-often heard statement from the new COVID cohort is that they were exer-
cising their “freedom” from the tyranny of government officials who have been urging 
Americans to be vaccinated.
However, freedom isn’t free, as those who are filling the critical care beds in our hos-
pitals are learning the hard way. Further, their freedom to die affects the rest of us, 
both by spreading the disease among their fellow citizens and pushing our healthcare 
system to the brink.
Ironically, getting a COVID-19 vaccination shot is among the least demanding of the 
many impositions on our freedom that all of us experience as Americans each and 
every day.
Even in our free society, we live with restrictions on our behavior in everything we 
do. No one has the right to walk naked down the street, to drive a car as fast as they 
want, or to not pay taxes, to name just the most obvious examples of restrictions on 
our personal freedom.
More to the point (no pun intended), many vaccines already are mandated from the 
time we are born in this country in order to attend public schools.
In addition, unscrupulous politicians (Trump, Cruz, DeSantis, et als), together with 
disingenuous social and traditional media, are amplifying this corrupted notion of 
absolute freedom.
Ultimately however, the decision to get the vaccine remains a personal choice. But as 
we watch the suffering among the unvaccinated, their pathetic plight brings to mind 
the title of the classic James Dean movie, Rebel Without a Cause.
Yes, the unvaccinated may be exercising their “freedom.”
But in the final analysis, what was the point of it all?

Dear Editor,
	 I met Kendra Hicks 
when she was in the 
8th grade. She was teaching 
basic Bachata steps at a 
street festival in the Latin 
Quarter of JP. I remember 
being impressed by her 
skills, confidence and pa-
tience, as she actually had 
me dancing in rhythm – 
not an easy task. 
	 Over the next several 
years I had the opportu-
nity to work with Kendra 
on a number of commu-
nity projects and I wit-
nessed the early stages of 
an evolving leader. During 
Kendra’s high school years, 
there was an epidemic of 
youth violence in Boston’s 
neighborhoods, including 
Jamaica Plain. Not only 
did Kendra directly feel the 
pain of this crisis through 
the loss of loved ones, but 

she transformed her sor-
row and anger into positive 
action as a young artist 
and activist. At age nine-
teen she put her passion 
to work by becoming an 
anti-violence street-work-
er. She was a relentless 
advocate. Her voice was 
authentic, it came from her 
heart, and people listened.
	 Now, I am so pleased to 
see that Kendra is coura-
geously running for elected 
office. At this moment in 
Boston’s history, when so 
much that used to seem 
impossible is now possible, 
we need to put Kendra onto 
the City Council. Boston, 
per capita, is one of the 
wealthiest cities in the 
world, but centuries-old 
systems have prevented 
this wealth from being 
distributed equitably into 
the neighborhoods. With 

her hopeful vision, youth-
ful perspective, clear policy 
positions, her driving ener-
gy and charisma, Kendra 
will make a difference. I 
want Kendra to be in City 
Hall chambers when cli-
mate change, racial equity 
and housing are debated. I 
particularly want her voice 
to be heard when the re-
lated issues of arts and 
youth mental health are 
discussed. I know she will 
bridge the social justice 
movement to City Hall.  
	 Kendra, with her savvy 
team, is running a state-
of-the-art campaign. But 
over the coming weeks, 
she needs and deserves 
our support, as she is in 
a tight race. We know she 
will work for us, and now 
is the time to work for her. 

Ken Tangvik

Dear Editor,
	 Mayor Janey’s indoor 
mask mandate for Boston 
is a great first step in help-
ing arts organizations and 
arts audiences find their 
way back together.  As a 
sector, the city’s arts com-
munity appreciates clear 
guidelines to help ensure 
the safest possible envi-
ronments for performers, 
staff and audiences. But 
the requirements need to 
go further.
	 In ArtsBoston’s newest 
Audience Outlook Monitor 
survey, 98% of respondents 
report being fully vaccinat-
ed, or planning to be. 
	 Nearly 80% want as-
surances their health is 

protected before they re-
turn to theater, dance and 
music performances. A 
vaccine requirement like 
the one announced recent-
ly by more than a dozen 
local theaters should be a 
mandate for indoor spac-
es where people gather 
to experience the joy of 
live performances. A cor-
ollary push to make vac-
cines more accessible to all 
communities will ensure 
equity as well as greater 
public health.
	 Recovery of the arts 
means a recovery of jobs 
and an economic boost for 
Boston.  After 18 months 
without income due to 
shutdowns, cultural or-

ganizations whose work 
has reliably realized an 
annual $2 billion econom-
ic boost for Greater Bos-
ton can’t continue to be 
hamstrung, forced to de-
fend common-sense prac-
tices while getting back 
on their feet.  Let’s follow 
the science that vaccines 
and masks together offer 
the best protection, and 
require vaccination for all 
indoor Boston gatherings.

	 Catherine Peterson is 
Executive Director of Arts-
Boston, the marketing, re-
search and advocacy group 
that supports arts and cul-
ture in Jamaica Plain and 
the Greater Boston region.

Letters

The Gazette welcomes letters to the  editor. Word limit: 500. Deadline: Friday at 5 p.m. one week before publication. Let-
ters  may be emailed to letters@JamaicaPlainGazette.com. Please include address and  telephone number for verification 

purposes. Anonymous  letters will not be published.  More information:  617-524-2626

Janey announces winners of Garden Contest
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continued in my own commu-
nity. This contest is a great way 
to affirm our city’s dedication to 
beautifying urban spaces, and 
plant a seed of interest in the 
next generation of gardeners.”
	 First place winners received 
the coveted “Golden Trowel” 
award from Mayor Janey while 
second and third place winners 
were awarded certificates. First 
place winners were entered into 
a drawing for a JetBlue Grand 
Prize consisting of roundtrip 
flights for two to any nonstop 
destination from Boston and also 
received a pair of tickets to the 
Isabella Stewart Gardner Muse-
um. Gift certificates were provid-
ed by Mahoney’s Garden Centers 
to the top three winners in each 

category as well as the 2021 Hall 
of Fame winners.
	 This year’s winners:

Shade Garden
• First Place: Sally Reyering - 
Beacon Hill
• Second Place: Errol and Jan 
Uys - Dorchester
• Third Place: Christa Comeau 
- Back Bay

Vegetable or Herb Garden
• First Place: Sunny Ha - Brigh-
ton
• Second Place: Pasqualino Cerro 
- Hyde Park
• Third Place: Amina Shabani - 
Brighton

Medium Yard Garden
• First Place: Jessica von Ammon 
- Roxbury
• Second Place: Linda Sklar - 
Jamaica Plain
• Third Place: Carey Moffitt-Jen-
kins and John Jenkins - Allston

Small Yard Garden
• First Place: Julia Fairclough - 
Roslindale
• Second Place: Doug Gifford - 
South End
• Third Place: Jill Christians - 
South End

Large Yard Garden
• First Place: Stephen Smith and 
Richard Allsbrook - Roslindale
• Second Place: Amy Galblum - 
Roslindale
• Third Place: Michael Bresinski 
- West Roxbury

Storefront, Organization, or 
Main Street District Garden
• First Place: Carroll Thomas 
Funeral Home - Hyde Park 
• Second Place: Friends of Chris-
topher Columbus Park - North 
End
• Third Place: Fairmount Hill 
Neighborhood Association - Hyde 
Park

Porch, Balcony, or 
Container Garden

• First Place: Alex and Stephanie 
Tsalagas - South End
• Second Place: Cindy Joyce - 
Back Bay
• Third Place: Bev Christians 
and Chris Hartmann - South End

 Community Garden
• First Place: Craig and Kimber-
ly McNulty - Fenway-Kenmore
• Second Place: John Ruiz - Fen-
way-Kenmore
• Third Place: Dionna Di Pierro 
and Steven Davy - Fenway-Ken-
more

Age Strong Garden Category
• First Place: Janice Dunlevy - 

Dorchester
• Second Place: Maria Termini 
- Roslindale
• Third Place: Arlene Simon - 
Dorchester
	 Gardeners who have won 
three or more times are auto-
matically entered into the Hall 
of Fame and will be recognized at 
the awards ceremony. These dis-
tinguished Hall-of-Famers will 
be ineligible to enter as contes-
tants but are welcome to return 
as judges. The 2021 Hall of Fame 
inductees are James Anderson, 
John Govoni and Dorothy Giarla, 
Miguel Rosales, and Julie Mur-
phy.

SERVICES
David at kNURD on Kall:com can 
help with PC computers, networks, 
audio/video/multimedia, phone solu-
tions. $Reasonable$. House calls. 
617-676-5676 or 617-522-6090.  

Offices JP over Eastern Bank:1 
person dark wainscot cream walls, 
$750/mo. Incl. electric, internet, air 
conditioning, large desk & chairs. 
2 Office suite large windows, hard-
wood floors, $1,500/mo. Absolute 
move in condition. Professional, qui-
et, no retail. 617-277-5900
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OFFICE FOR RENT

LEGAL NOTICE
COMMONWEALTH 

OF MASSACHUSETTS
THE TRIAL COURT

PROBATE AND
FAMILY COURT
Suffolk Probate

and Family Court
24 New Chardon St.
Boston, MA 02114
(617)788-8300

CITATION ON 
PETITION FOR

FORMAL
ADJUDICATION

Docket No.
SU21P1196EA

Estate of:
Elinor Stone

Date of Death
06/14/2020

To all interested persons:
A Petition for Formal 
Adjudication of Intestacy and 
Appointment of Personal 
Representative has been filed 
by Robin Solit of Montclair, 
NJ requesting that the Court 
enter a formal Decree and 
Order and for such other relief 
as requested in the Petition.
The Petitioner requests that: 
Robin Solit of Montclair, NJ be 
appointed as Personal Repre-
sentative(s) of said estate to 
serve With Corporate Surety 
on the bond in unsupervised 
administration.
IMPORTANT NOTICE	
You have the right to obtain 
a copy of the Petition from 
the Petitioner or at the Court. 
You have a right to object 
to this proceeding. To do so, 
you or your attorney must 
file a written appearance and 
objection at this Court before: 
10:00 a.m. on the return day 
of 09/22/2021.
This is NOT a hearing date, 
but a deadline by which you 
must file a written appearance 

and objection if you object 
to this proceeding. If you 
fail to file a timely written 
appearance and objection 
followed by an affidavit of 
objections within thirty (30) 
days of the return day, action 
may be taken without further 
notice to you.
UNSUPERVISED ADMIN-
ISTRATION UNDER THE 
MASSACHUSETTS UNIFORM 
PROBATE CODE (MUPC)
A Personal Representative 
appointed under the MUPC in 
an unsupervised administra-
tion is not required to file an 
inventory or annual accounts 
with the Court. Persons 
interested in the estate are en-
titled to notice regarding the 
administration directly from 
the Personal Representative 
and may petition the Court 
in any matter relating to the 
estate, including the distribu-
tion of assets and expenses of 
administration.
WITNESS, Hon. Brian J. Dunn, 
First Justice of this Court.
Date: August 17, 2021

Felix D. Arroyo
Register of Probate

8/27/21
JP

LEGAL NOTICE
COMMONWEALTH 

OF MASSACHUSETTS
THE TRIAL COURT

PROBATE AND
FAMILY COURT
Suffolk Probate

And Family Court
24 New Chardon St.
Boston, MA 02114
(617)788-8300

CITATION ON 
PETITION FOR

FORMAL
ADJUDICATION

Docket No.
SU21P1594EA

Estate of:
Russell W. 

Sweeney, Jr.
Also Known As:
Date of Death:
05/09/2021

To all interested persons:
Timothy Sweeney of Fairfield, 
CT requesting that the Court 
enter a formal Decree and 
Order and for such other relief 
as requested in the Petition.
IMPORTANT NOTICE	
You have the right to obtain 
a copy of the Petition from 
the Petitioner or at the Court. 
You have a right to object 
to this proceeding. To do so, 
you or your attorney must 
file a written appearance and 
objection at this Court before: 
10:00 a.m. on the return day 
of 09/23/2021.
This is NOT a hearing date, 
but a deadline by which you 
must file a written appearance 
and objection if you object 
to this proceeding. If you 
fail to file a timely written 
appearance and objection 
followed by an affidavit of 
objections within thirty (30) 
days of the return day, action 
may be taken without further 
notice to you.
UNSUPERVISED ADMIN-
ISTRATION UNDER THE 
MASSACHUSETTS UNIFORM 
PROBATE CODE (MUPC)
A Personal Representative 
appointed under the MUPC in 
an unsupervised administra-
tion is not required to file an 
inventory or annual accounts 
with the Court. Persons 
interested in the estate are en-
titled to notice regarding the 
administration directly from 
the Personal Representative 
and may petition the Court 
in any matter relating to the 

estate, including the distribu-
tion of assets and expenses of 
administration.
WITNESS, Hon. Brian J. Dunn, 
First Justice of this Court.
Date: August 10, 2021

Felix D. Arroyo
Register of Probate

8/27/21
JP

LEGAL NOTICE
Commonwealth of

Massachusetts
The Trial Court
Probate and
Family Court

CITATION GIVING
NOTICE OF 

PETITION FOR
APPOINTMENT OF
GUARDIAN FOR 
INCAPACITATED

PERSON PURSUANT
TO G.L. C. 190B,

§5-304
Docket No. 

SU21P1595GD
Suffolk Probate and

Family Court
24 New Chardon Street

Boston, MA 02114
(617) 788-8300
In the matter of:
Steven Gowey

Of: Jamaica Plain, MA
To the named Respondent and 
all other interested persons, 
a petition has been filed by 
Brigham and Women’s F. 
Hospital of Boston, MA in 
the above captioned matter 
alleging that Steven Gowey 
is in need of a Guardian and 
requesting that (or some other 
suitable person) be appointed 
as Guardian to serve Without 
Surety on the bond.
The petition asks the court 
to determine that the 

Respondent is incapacitated, 
that the appointment of a 
Guardian is necessary, and 
that the proposed Guardian is 
appropriate.  The petition is 
on file with this court and may 
contain a request for certain 
specific authority.
You have the right to object to 
this proceeding. If you wish 
to do so, you or your attorney 
must file a written appearance 
at this court on or before 
10:00 A.M. on the return 
date of 09/09/2021. This 
day is NOT a hearing date, 
but a deadline date by which 
you have to file the written ap-
pearance if you object to the 
petition. If you fail the written 
appearance by the return 
date, action may be taken in 
this matter without further 
notice to you. In addition to 
filing the written appearance, 
you or your attorney must file 
a written affidavit stating the 
specific facts and grounds of 
your objection within 30 days 
after the return date.
IMPORTANT
NOTICE
The outcome of this proceed-
ing may limit or completely 
take away the above-named 
person’s right to make 
decisions about personal 
affairs or financial affairs 
or both. The above-named 
person has the right to ask for 
a lawyer. Anyone may make 
this request on behalf of the 
above-named person. If the 
above-named person cannot 
afford a lawyer, one may be 
appointed at State expense.
WITNESS, Hon. Brian J. Dunn, 
First Justice of this Court.
Date: July 29, 2021
Felix D. Arroyo
Register of Probate

8/27/21
JP

Garden Contest
Continued from page 14

Do You need to run a legal notice?
Don’t forget to check at the court to see if you qualify for a fee-waiver!
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UNLIMITED SOTHEBY’S INTERNATIONAL REALTY | 673 Centre Street, Jamaica Plain | 617.522.2200 | jprealestate.com

For Your Next Adventure

24 Gay Head Street - JP

Offered at $1,099,000

4 Bed | 2.5 Bath | 2387 Sq.Ft.

Roger Rodriguez, 617.504.0199 

30 Beaufort Rd, Unit 30-3 - JP

Offered at $750,000

2 Bed | 1 Bath | 1250 Sq.Ft.

Brilliant Places, 617.694.9759

39 Goldsmith St - JP

Offered at $1,400,000

5 Bed | 3 Bath | 3537 Sq.Ft.

Brilliant Places, 617.694.9759

31 Millmont St, Unit 1 - Fort Hill

Offered at $829,000

2 Bed | 2.5 Bath | 1442 Sq.Ft.

Chuck Silverston, 617.699.6234

214 Perkins St, Unit F301 - JP

Offered at $749,000

3 Bed | 2.5 Bath | 1252 Sq.Ft.

Arman Mavai, 617.817.6789

Enrique Darer, 617.947.4000.

149 Centre St, Unit 1 - Fort Hill

Offered at $400,000

2 Bed | 1 Bath | 845 Sq.Ft.

Liora Nielsen, 617.953.0051

104 Williams St - JP

Offered at $1,300,000

6 Bed | 3 Bath | 2856 Sq.Ft.

Brilliant Places, 617.694.9759

10 Williams St, Unit 33 - Roxbury

Offered at $765,000

1 Bed | 1 Bath | 1443 Sq.Ft.

Good Boston Living, 617.971.7080

524 Poplar St - Roslindale

Offered at $700,000

4 Bed | 2 Bath | 2000 Sq.Ft.

Brilliant Places, 617.694.9759
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